
Sample Rating Trend

NORMALOIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Machine Id

190124G007
Component

Unknown Component
Fluid

TOTAL ENERGIES RENAULT LONGEVIA TCX ECO 75W90 (--- GAL)

 DIAGNOSIS

Recommendation

This is a baseline read-out on the submitted

sample.

Wear

{not applicable}

Contamination

{not applicable}

Fluid Condition

{not applicable}

Report Id: WEAINT [WCAMIS] 02610794 (Generated: 01/29/2024 10:47:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Kenny De Smet - WEAINT

 SAMPLE INFORMATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Sample Number Client Info PP --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 19 Jan 2024 --- ---

Machine Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Changed Client Info N/A --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL --- ---

 CONTAMINATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Water WC Method NEG --- ---

 SIMULATED DISTILLATON (GCD)method limit/base current history1 history2

(GCD) % < 335°C °C ASTM D2887* 4.77 --- ---

(GCD) Initial Boiling Point °C ASTM D2887* 101.4 --- ---

(GCD) 5% Distillation Point °C ASTM D2887* 332.2 --- ---

(GCD) 10% Distillation Point °C ASTM D2887* 378.6 --- ---

(GCD) 20% Distillation Point °C ASTM D2887* 409.8 --- ---

(GCD) 30% Distillation Point °C ASTM D2887* 423.3 --- ---

(GCD) 40% Distillation Point °C ASTM D2887* 434.1 --- ---

(GCD) 50% Distillation Point °C ASTM D2887* 445.6 --- ---

(GCD) 60% Distillation Point °C ASTM D2887* 456.9 --- ---

(GCD) 70% Distillation Point °C ASTM D2887* 469.1 --- ---

(GCD) 80% Distillation Point °C ASTM D2887* 483.0 --- ---

(GCD) 90% Distillation Point °C ASTM D2887* 502.5 --- ---

(GCD) FBP% Distillation Point °C ASTM D2887* 564.2 --- ---

 SAMPLE IMAGES method limit/base current history1 history2

Color no image no image no image

Bottom no image no image no image

Page 1 of 2



OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Laboratory : WearCheck - C8-1175 Appleby Line, Burlington, ON L7L 5H9

Sample No. : PP

Lab Number : 02610794

Unique Number : 5711880

Test Package : TEST ( Additional Tests: GC-PercFuel, GCD )

Recieved : 23 Jan 2024

Diagnosed : 29 Jan 2024

Diagnostician : Bill Quesnel

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

Validity of results and interpretation are based on the sample and information as supplied.

Alpha Maintenance Systems

WearCheck Belgium, 713 Bergensesteenweg

St.-Pieters-Leeuw, ZZ

BE  B-1600

Contact: Kenny De Smet

Kenny.DESMET@alphams.eu

T: 

F: 3(202)361-3458

Report Id: WEAINT [WCAMIS] 02610794 (Generated: 01/29/2024 10:47:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Kenny De Smet - WEAINT

 GRAPHS

Report Id: WEAINT [WCAMIS] 02610794 (Generated: 01/29/2024 10:47:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Kenny De Smet - WEAINT

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-5711880-4368212&lid=5711880&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	190124G007\Unknown Component [PP] 19 Jan 2024 @ .0 hrs

