
OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

WEAR NORMAL

CONTAMINATION NORMAL

FLUID CONDITION NORMAL

Machine Id

183
Component

Rear Transmission (Auto)
Fluid

Report Id: CITTHU [WCAMIS] 00057755 (Generated: 03/05/2024 18:29:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Sean Malcolm - CITTHU

Test Limit/AbnUOM Method Current History1 History2

Sample Number Client Info WC00011629 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 13 Aug 1990 --- ---

Machine Age kms Client Info 180897 --- ---

Oil Age kms Client Info 48000 --- ---

Filter Age kms Client Info 48000 --- ---

Sample Status --- --- ---

Water WC Method NEG --- ---

RECOMMENDATION

 

WEAR

 

Page 1 of 2



CITY OF THUNDER BAY

AUTO MAINTENANCE STORES, 570 FORT WILLIAM ROAD

THUNDER BAY, ON

CA  P7B 2Z8

Contact: Sean Malcolm

sean.malcolm@thunderbay.ca

T: (807)684-2716

F: (807)344-0237

Laboratory : WearCheck - C8-1175 Appleby Line, Burlington, ON L7L 5H9

Sample No. : WC00011629

Lab Number : 00057755

Unique Number : 24237

Test Package : MOB 1

Received : 16 Aug 1990

Tested : 16 Aug 1990

Diagnosed : 

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

Validity of results and interpretation are based on the sample and information as supplied.

Report Id: CITTHU [WCAMIS] 00057755 (Generated: 03/05/2024 18:29:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Sean Malcolm - CITTHU

Page 2 of 2
Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-24237-40536&lid=24237&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	ALLISON 183\Rear Transmission (Auto) [WC00011629] 13 Aug 1990 @ 180897.0 hrs

