
OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

WEAR NORMAL

CONTAMINATION NORMAL

FLUID CONDITION NORMAL

Machine Id

FORD 1994
Component

Gasoline Engine
Fluid

Report Id: GATMIS [WCAMIS] 00995996 (Generated: 02/04/2024 05:09:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Patrick Gattafoni - GATMIS

Test Limit/AbnUOM Method Current History1 History2

Sample Number Client Info WC576689 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 22 Dec 2002 --- ---

Machine Age kms Client Info 212929 --- ---

Oil Age kms Client Info 8000 --- ---

Filter Age kms Client Info 8000 --- ---

Oil Changed Client Info Changed --- ---

Filter Changed Client Info Changed --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL --- ---

Fuel WC Method <1.0 --- ---

Water WC Method NEG --- ---

Glycol WC Method NEG --- ---

RECOMMENDATION

Resample at the next service interval to monitor.

WEAR

All component wear rates are normal.

Page 1 of 2



PATRICK GATTAFONI

3037 POST ROAD

OAKVILLE, ON

CA  L6H 0M3

Contact: Patrick Gattafoni

patgat@rogers.com

T: (416)419-1875

F:  x:

Laboratory : WearCheck - C8-1175 Appleby Line, Burlington, ON L7L 5H9

Sample No. : WC576689

Lab Number : 00995996

Unique Number : 1445805

Test Package : MOB 2

Recieved : 24 Dec 2002

Diagnosed : 30 Dec 2002

Diagnostician : Kevin Marson

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

Validity of results and interpretation are based on the sample and information as supplied.

Report Id: GATMIS [WCAMIS] 00995996 (Generated: 02/04/2024 05:09:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Patrick Gattafoni - GATMIS

Page 2 of 2
Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-1445805-609904&lid=1445805&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	FORD FORD 1994\Gasoline Engine [WC576689] 22 Dec 2002 @ 212929.0 hrs

