
OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

WEAR NORMAL

CONTAMINATION SEVERE

FLUID CONDITION NORMAL

Machine Id

RADAR SITE MOTOR#1
Component

Unknown Component
Fluid

{not provided} (--- LTR)

Report Id: NAVOTT [WCAMIS] 01023773 (Generated: 04/24/2024 15:43:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Francis Gravel - NAVOTT

Test Limit/AbnUOM Method Current History1 History2

Sample Number Client Info WC0038709 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 29 Apr 2003 --- ---

Machine Age yrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Age yrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Filter Age yrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Changed Client Info N/A --- ---

Filter Changed Client Info N/A --- ---

Sample Status SEVERE --- ---

Water WC Method NEG --- ---

RECOMMENDATION

We advise that you check all areas where dirt can enter the system.

We recommend either performing an oil change or oil filtration.  We

cannot recommend specific action as we have limited information with

regards to reservoir capacity and/or lubricant type.

WEAR

All component wear rates are normal.

Page 1 of 2



NAV CANADA

280 HUNT CLUB ROAD

OTTAWA, ON

CA  K1V 1C1

Contact: Francis Gravel

Radar@navcanada.ca

T: (613)299-9735

F: (613)248-7195

Laboratory : WearCheck - C8-1175 Appleby Line, Burlington, ON L7L 5H9

Sample No. : WC0038709

Lab Number : 01023773

Unique Number : 1513631

Test Package : IND 2

Received : 05 May 2003

Tested : 06 May 2003

Diagnosed : 

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

Validity of results and interpretation are based on the sample and information as supplied.

Report Id: NAVOTT [WCAMIS] 01023773 (Generated: 04/24/2024 15:43:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Francis Gravel - NAVOTT

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-1513631-638029&lid=1513631&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	RADAR SITE MOTOR#1\Unknown Component [WC0038709] 29 Apr 2003 @ .0 hrs

