
OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

WEAR NORMAL

CONTAMINATION NORMAL

FLUID CONDITION NORMAL

Machine Id

VOLVO EC360 03048
Component

Hydraulic System
Fluid

{not provided} (--- GAL)

Report Id: LBSGAR [WUSCAR] 00513192 (Generated: 02/02/2024 02:28:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TOMMY TORRENCE - LBSGAR

Test Limit/AbnUOM Method Current History1 History2

Sample Number Client Info VC061851 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 09 May 2003 --- ---

Machine Age hrs Client Info 5639 --- ---

Oil Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Filter Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Changed Client Info Not Changd --- ---

Filter Changed Client Info Not Changd --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL --- ---

Water WC Method NEG --- ---

RECOMMENDATION

Resample at the next service interval to monitor.

WEAR

All component wear rates are normal.

Page 1 of 2



ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - GARNER

3561 JONES SAUSAGE ROAD

GARNER, NC

US  27529

Contact: TOMMY TORRENCE

tommy.torrence@lbsmith.com

T: (919)661-8710

F: (919)661-9038

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : VC061851

Lab Number : 00513192

Unique Number : 1671605

Test Package : MOB 2

Recieved : 13 May 2003

Diagnosed : 19 May 2003

Diagnostician : Doug Bogart

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-237-1369.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

Report Id: LBSGAR [WUSCAR] 00513192 (Generated: 02/02/2024 02:28:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TOMMY TORRENCE - LBSGAR

Page 2 of 2
Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-1671605-640281&lid=1671605&oem_template=VOLVO
http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC360 03048\Hydraulic System [VC061851] 09 May 2003 @ 5639.0 hrs

