
OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

WEAR SEVERE

CONTAMINATION ABNORMAL

FLUID CONDITION NORMAL

Machine Id

36-256P (S/N 36-2569)
Component

Hydraulic System
Fluid

Report Id: SPAFRA [WUSCAR] 00575851 (Generated: 06/11/2024 12:25:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Mark McKinley - SPAFRA

Test Limit/AbnUOM Method Current History1 History2

Sample Number Client Info WCI2023615 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 22 Mar 2003 --- ---

Machine Age mls Client Info 14 --- ---

Oil Age mls Client Info 0 --- ---

Filter Age mls Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Changed Client Info Not Changd --- ---

Filter Changed Client Info Not Changd --- ---

Sample Status SEVERE --- ---

Water WC Method NEG --- ---

RECOMMENDATION

We were unable to perform a particle count due to a high concentration

of particles present in this sample. We recommend you service the

filters on this component. We recommend an early resample to monitor

this condition.

WEAR

High concentration of visible metal present. All component wear rates

are normal.

Page 1 of 2



TADANO MANTIS CORPORATION

2680 S FRONT ST

RICHLANDS, VA

US  24641

Contact: Mark McKinley

mark.mckinley@tadano.com

T: (615)224-7110

F: (615)790-6803

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : WCI2023615

Lab Number : 00575851

Unique Number : 1769323

Test Package : IND 2

Received : 30 Jul 2003

Tested : 31 Jul 2003

Diagnosed : 31 Jul 2003 - Doug Bogart

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-237-1369.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

Report Id: SPAFRA [WUSCAR] 00575851 (Generated: 06/11/2024 12:25:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Mark McKinley - SPAFRA

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-1769323-664939&lid=1769323&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	36-256P (S/N 36-2569)\Hydraulic System [WCI2023615] 22 Mar 2003 @ 14.0 hrs

