
OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

WEAR NORMAL

CONTAMINATION NORMAL

FLUID CONDITION NORMAL

Machine Id

MITSUBISHI MITSUBISHI MONTERO
Component

Diesel Engine
Fluid

TRC MOLY XL PROSPEC III 10W30 (5 QTS)

Report Id: STEMISTX [WUSCAR] 01479961 (Generated: 05/02/2024 10:51:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE SMITH - STEMISTX

Test Limit/AbnUOM Method Current History1 History2

Sample Number Client Info TR01479961 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 24 Nov 2005 --- ---

Machine Age mls Client Info 45525 --- ---

Oil Age mls Client Info 5518 --- ---

Filter Age mls Client Info 5518 --- ---

Oil Changed Client Info Not Changd --- ---

Filter Changed Client Info Not Changd --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL --- ---

Fuel WC Method <1.0 --- ---

Water WC Method NEG --- ---

Glycol WC Method NEG --- ---

RECOMMENDATION

Resample at the next service interval to monitor.

WEAR

All component wear rates are normal.

Page 1 of 2



STEVE SMITH

2718 ALAMEDA CIRCLE

MISSION, TX

US  78574

Contact: STEVE SMITH

ses_trc@yahoo.com

T: (956)240-3890

F: (956)581-8112

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : TR01479961

Lab Number : 01479961

Unique Number : 3317353

Test Package : MOB 2

Received : 28 Nov 2005

Tested : 29 Nov 2005

Diagnosed : 

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-827-0711.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

Report Id: STEMISTX [WUSCAR] 01479961 (Generated: 05/02/2024 10:51:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE SMITH - STEMISTX

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-3317353-1398585&lid=3317353&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	MITSUBISHI MITSUBISHI MITSUBISHI MONTERO\Diesel Engine [TR01479961] 24 Nov 2005 @ 45525.0 hrs

