
OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

WEAR NORMAL

CONTAMINATION ABNORMAL

FLUID CONDITION NORMAL

Machine Id

GROVE GFK6300-4029 390490 LIFTALL BLUE
Component

Hydraulic System
Fluid

{not provided} (--- GAL)

Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02608230 (Generated: 01/15/2024 09:38:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Crane - Sue Hooton - VOLVO0252

Test Limit/AbnUOM Method Current History1 History2

Sample Number Client Info WC0872279 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 05 Jan 2024 --- ---

Machine Age hrs Client Info 10849 --- ---

Oil Age hrs Client Info 10849 --- ---

Filter Age hrs Client Info 10849 --- ---

Oil Changed Client Info Not Changd --- ---

Filter Changed Client Info Not Changd --- ---

Sample Status ABNORMAL --- ---

Iron >20ppm ASTM D5185(m) 2 --- ---

Chromium >10ppm ASTM D5185(m) 1 --- ---

Nickel >10ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 --- ---

Titanium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Silver ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Aluminum >10ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 --- ---

Lead >10ppm ASTM D5185(m) 2 --- ---

Copper >75ppm ASTM D5185(m) 4 --- ---

Tin >10ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Vanadium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

White Metal NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Yellow Metal NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Silicon >20ppm ASTM D5185(m) 3 --- ---

Potassium >20ppm ASTM D5185(m) 4 --- ---

Water >0.1% ASTM D6304* 0.034 --- ---

ppm Water >1000ppm ASTM D6304* 349 --- ---

Silt NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Debris NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Sand/Dirt NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Appearance NORMLscalar Visual* WGOIL --- ---

Odor NORMLscalar Visual* NORML --- ---

Emulsified Water >0.1scalar Visual* .2% --- ---

Sodium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 1 --- ---

Boron ppm ASTM D5185(m) 6 --- ---

Barium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Molybdenum ppm ASTM D5185(m) 2 --- ---

Manganese ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Magnesium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 51 --- ---

Calcium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 176 --- ---

Phosphorus ppm ASTM D5185(m) 404 --- ---

Zinc ppm ASTM D5185(m) 446 --- ---

Sulfur ppm ASTM D5185(m) 1588 --- ---

Visc @ 40°C cSt ASTM D7279(m) 30.4 --- ---

RECOMMENDATION

We advise that you check for the source of water entry. We

recommend that you drain the oil from the component if this has not

already been done. We recommend an early resample to monitor this

condition. Please specify the brand, type, and viscosity of the oil on

your next sample. Please contact your representative for information

regarding the proper sampling kits for your service. NOTE:  We

recommend using MOB 2 test kits, this testkit includes Particle Count

to determine the ISO cleanliness of the fluid.

WEAR

All component wear rates are normal.

CONTAMINATION

Excessive free water present.

FLUID CONDITION

Viscosity of sample indicates oil is within ISO 32 range, advise

investigate. The oil is no longer serviceable due to the presence of

contaminants.

Page 1 of 2



STRONGCO EQUIPMENT (CE)

1051 Heritage Rd.

Burlington, ON

CA  L7L 4Y1

Contact: Sue Hooton

shooton@strongco.com

T: (905)331-3835

F: (905)643-6077

Laboratory : WearCheck - C8-1175 Appleby Line, Burlington, ON L7L 5H9

Sample No. : WC0872279

Lab Number : 02608230

Unique Number : 5709316

Test Package : MOB 1 ( Additional Tests: KF )

Recieved : 11 Jan 2024

Diagnosed : 15 Jan 2024

Diagnostician : Kevin Marson

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

Validity of results and interpretation are based on the sample and information as supplied.

Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02608230 (Generated: 01/15/2024 09:38:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Crane - Sue Hooton - VOLVO0252

Page 2 of 2
Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-5709316-4363392&lid=5709316&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	GROVE GROVE GFK6300-4029 390490 LIFTALL BLUE\Hydraulic System [WC0872279] 05 Jan 2024 @ 10849.0 hrs

