
OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

CORROSION NORMAL

CONTAMINANTS ABNORMAL

COOLANT CONDITION NORMAL

Area

[8000389895]
Machine Id

VOLVO ECR305CL 110051
Component

Coolant
Fluid

{not provided} (--- GAL)

Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02609152 (Generated: 01/31/2024 16:11:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS

Test Limit/AbnUOM Method Current History1 History2

Sample Number Client Info VCP393161 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 15 Jan 2024 --- ---

Machine Age hrs Client Info 15678 --- ---

Oil Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Changed Client Info Not Changd --- ---

Sample Status ABNORMAL --- ---

White Metal NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Yellow Metal NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Water % ASTM D6304* 32.22 --- ---

ppm Water ppm ASTM D6304* 322299 --- ---

Silt NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Debris NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Sand/Dirt NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Appearance NORMLscalar Visual* OILWG --- ---

Odor NORMLscalar Visual* NORML --- ---

RECOMMENDATION

We advise that you check all areas where contaminants can enter the

system. We recommend that you drain the coolant from the component

if this has not already been done. We recommend an early resample to

monitor this condition.

CORROSION

{not applicable}

CONTAMINANTS

The sample contained a visible layer of foreign fluid contaminant, the

origin and/or type of fluid is unknown.

Page 1 of 2



STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.

1640 ENTERPRISE ROAD

MISSISSAUGA, ON

CA  L4W 4L4

Contact: Janice Cripps

jcripps@strongco.com

T: (905)565-3876

F: (905)670-2338

Laboratory : WearCheck - C8-1175 Appleby Line, Burlington, ON L7L 5H9

Sample No. : VCP393161

Lab Number : 02609152

Unique Number : 5710238

Test Package : TEST ( Additional Tests: KF )

Recieved : 16 Jan 2024

Diagnosed : 23 Jan 2024

Diagnostician : Kevin Marson

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

Validity of results and interpretation are based on the sample and information as supplied.

Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02609152 (Generated: 01/31/2024 16:11:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS

Page 2 of 2
Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-5710238-4364553&lid=5710238&oem_template=VOLVO
http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR305CL 110051\Coolant [VCP393161] 15 Jan 2024 @ 15678.0 hrs

