
OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

CORROSION NORMAL

CONTAMINANTS ABNORMAL

FUEL CONDITION NORMAL

Machine Id

515543 FRESHSTART
Component

Diesel Fuel
Fluid

{not provided} (--- LTR)

Report Id: ALTCAM [WCAMIS] 02609153 (Generated: 01/16/2024 17:54:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Tom Heeley - ALTCAM

Test Limit/AbnUOM Method Current History1 History2

Sample Number Client Info IL0019065 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 15 Jan 2024 --- ---

Machine Age kms Client Info 315877 --- ---

Sample Status ABNORMAL --- ---

White Metal NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Yellow Metal NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Water >0.05% ASTM D6304* 100 --- ---

Silt NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Debris NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Sand/Dirt NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Appearance NORMLscalar Visual* WGOIL --- ---

Odor NORMLscalar Visual* NORML --- ---

RECOMMENDATION

This is a baseline read-out on the submitted sample.

CORROSION

{not applicable}

CONTAMINANTS

Water contamination levels are abnormal.   The bottom layer is 100%

water.

Page 1 of 2



ALTRUCK IDEALEASE

120 MCGOVERN DRIVE

CAMBRIDGE, ON

CA  N3H 4R7

Contact: Tom Heeley

tom.heeley@altruck.com

T: (519)650-3670

F: (519)650-2050

Laboratory : WearCheck - C8-1175 Appleby Line, Burlington, ON L7L 5H9

Sample No. : IL0019065

Lab Number : 02609153

Unique Number : 5710239

Test Package : TEST ( Additional Tests: KF )

Recieved : 16 Jan 2024

Diagnosed : 16 Jan 2024

Diagnostician : Kevin Marson

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

Validity of results and interpretation are based on the sample and information as supplied.

Report Id: ALTCAM [WCAMIS] 02609153 (Generated: 01/16/2024 17:54:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Tom Heeley - ALTCAM

Page 2 of 2
Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-5710239-4364555&lid=5710239&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	515543 FRESHSTART\Diesel Fuel [IL0019065] 15 Jan 2024 @ 315877.0 hrs

