
OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

CORROSION NORMAL

CONTAMINANTS ABNORMAL

FUEL CONDITION ABNORMAL

Area

[59462]
Machine Id

TG.180
Component

Diesel Fuel
Fluid

{not provided} (--- GAL)

Report Id: DETSTE [WCAMIS] 02616497 (Generated: 02/26/2024 09:45:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Steve Racine - DETSTE

Test Limit/AbnUOM Method Current History1 History2

Sample Number Client Info WA0021136 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 12 Feb 2024 --- ---

Machine Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Sample Status ABNORMAL --- ---

White Metal NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Yellow Metal NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Hydrocarbon scalar In-House* MODERATE --- ---

Silt NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Debris NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Sand/Dirt NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Appearance NORMLscalar Visual* HAZY --- ---

Odor NORMLscalar Visual* NORML --- ---

Urea Content <31.8% ISO 22241* 32.2 --- ---

Density @ 20°C >1.0930g/cm3 ISO 22241* 1.0853 --- ---

Refracting Index <1.3814ISO 22241* 1.3821 --- ---

Appearance scalar Visual* Cloudy --- ---

RECOMMENDATION

Nous vous recommandons de vérifier tous les endroits par lesquels

des contaminants peuvent pénétrer dans le système. Nous vous

recommandons de vidanger le carburant de ce composant si vous ne

l`avez pas déjà fait.

CORROSION

{sans objet}

CONTAMINANTS

L`échantillon contenait une couche visible de contaminants fluide

étrangers.

FUEL CONDITION

Teneur en urée est élevée . le carburant ne peut plus être utilisée en

raison de la présence de contaminants.

Page 1 of 2



Sample Color & Clarity

Wajax Limited

2997 AV. WATT

Quebec, QC

CA  G1X 3W1

Contact: Steve Racine

sracine@wajax.com

T: 

F: (418)651-4448

Laboratory : WearCheck - C8-1175 Appleby Line, Burlington, ON L7L 5H9

Sample No. : WA0021136

Lab Number : 02616497

Unique Number : 5733607

Test Package : DEF 1

Received : 16 Feb 2024

Tested : 22 Feb 2024

Diagnosed : 22 Feb 2024 - Kevin Marson

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

Validity of results and interpretation are based on the sample and information as supplied.

Report Id: DETSTE [WCAMIS] 02616497 (Generated: 02/26/2024 09:45:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Steve Racine - DETSTE

Page 2 of 2
Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-5733607-4379664&lid=5733607&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	TG.180\Diesel Fuel [WA0021136] 12 Feb 2024 @ .0 hrs

