
OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

WEAR ABNORMAL

CONTAMINATION NORMAL

FLUID CONDITION NORMAL

Machine Id

661054642
Component

Transmission (Auto)
Fluid

CASTROL TRANSYND (--- GAL)

Report Id: STR121MON [WCAMIS] 02628246 (Generated: 04/11/2024 16:09:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Herbert Gerald - STR121MON

Test Limit/AbnUOM Method Current History1 History2

Sample Number Client Info WA0021181 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 10 Apr 2024 --- ---

Machine Age hrs Client Info 9797 --- ---

Oil Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Filter Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Changed Client Info N/A --- ---

Filter Changed Client Info N/A --- ---

Sample Status ABNORMAL --- ---

Iron >300ppm ASTM D5185(m) 171 --- ---

Chromium >2ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 --- ---

Nickel >4ppm ASTM D5185(m) 1 --- ---

Titanium >3ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Silver >5ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Aluminum >70ppm ASTM D5185(m) 64 --- ---

Lead >85ppm ASTM D5185(m) 41 --- ---

Copper >90ppm ASTM D5185(m) 89 --- ---

Tin >10ppm ASTM D5185(m) 14 --- ---

Vanadium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

White Metal NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Yellow Metal NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Silicon >20ppm ASTM D5185(m) 6 --- ---

Potassium >20ppm ASTM D5185(m) 7 --- ---

Water >0.1WC Method NEG --- ---

Silt NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Debris NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Sand/Dirt NONEscalar Visual* VLITE --- ---

Appearance NORMLscalar Visual* NORML --- ---

Odor NORMLscalar Visual* NORML --- ---

Emulsified Water >0.1scalar Visual* NEG --- ---

Sodium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 8 --- ---

Boron 150ppm ASTM D5185(m) 89 --- ---

Barium 0ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 --- ---

Molybdenum 0ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Manganese ppm ASTM D5185(m) 2 --- ---

Magnesium 0ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 --- ---

Calcium 40ppm ASTM D5185(m) 45 --- ---

Phosphorus 320ppm ASTM D5185(m) 260 --- ---

Zinc 5ppm ASTM D5185(m) 9 --- ---

Sulfur 1050ppm ASTM D5185(m) 572 --- ---

Visc @ 40°C 38.9cSt ASTM D7279(m) 36.6 --- ---

RECOMMENDATION

We recommend that you drain the fluid from the component if this has

not already been done. We recommend an early resample to monitor

this condition.

WEAR

Tin ppm levels are abnormal. Bearing wear is indicated.

CONTAMINATION

There is no indication of any contamination in the fluid.

FLUID CONDITION

The fluid is no longer serviceable as a result of the abnormal and/or

severe wear.

Page 1 of 2



Strescon Limited

1212 Berry Mills Rd

Moncton, NB

CA  E1E 0A2

Contact: Herbert Gerald

herbert.gerald@Strescon.com

T: 

F: 

Laboratory : WearCheck - C8-1175 Appleby Line, Burlington, ON L7L 5H9

Sample No. : WA0021181

Lab Number : 02628246

Unique Number : 5761378

Test Package : MOB 1

Received : 11 Apr 2024

Tested : 11 Apr 2024

Diagnosed : 11 Apr 2024 - Kevin Marson

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

Validity of results and interpretation are based on the sample and information as supplied.

Report Id: STR121MON [WCAMIS] 02628246 (Generated: 04/11/2024 16:09:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Herbert Gerald - STR121MON

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-5761378-4407399&lid=5761378&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	ALLISON 661054642\Transmission (Auto) [WA0021181] 10 Apr 2024 @ 9797.0 hrs

