
OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

CORROSION NORMAL

CONTAMINANTS NORMAL

FUEL CONDITION NORMAL

Machine Id

8331
Component

Diesel Fuel
Fluid

No.2 DIESEL FUEL (ULTRALOW SULPHUR) (--- GAL)

Report Id: GFL747 [WCAMIS] 02633971 (Generated: 05/07/2024 16:05:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Steve Voyer - GFL747

Test Limit/AbnUOM Method Current History1 History2

Sample Number Client Info GFL0120764 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 19 Apr 2024 --- ---

Machine Age kms Client Info 329670 --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL --- ---

Iron >2ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Chromium >2ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Nickel >2ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Titanium >2ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Silver >2ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Aluminum >2ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Lead >2ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Copper >2ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Tin >2ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Vanadium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

White Metal NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Yellow Metal NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Silicon >10ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Potassium >20ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Silt NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Debris NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Sand/Dirt NONEscalar Visual* NONE --- ---

Appearance NORMLscalar Visual* NORML --- ---

Odor NORMLscalar Visual* NORML --- ---

Emulsified Water >0.05scalar Visual* NEG --- ---

Sodium >5ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 --- ---

Boron 2ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Barium 2ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Molybdenum 2ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Manganese ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Magnesium 2ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Calcium 2ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Phosphorus 2ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Zinc 2ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 --- ---

Sulfur 10ppm ASTM D5185(m) 7 --- ---

Visc @ 40°C 3.0cSt ASTM D7279(m) 2.3 --- ---

RECOMMENDATION

Veuillez communiquer avec un représentant GFL Environmental au

sujet de l`achat d`une trousse d`échantillonnage appropriée à vos

besoins.

CORROSION

{sans objet}

CONTAMINANTS

Il n`y a aucune indication de contamination dans le composant (non

confirmée).

FUEL CONDITION

La quantité de l’échantillonnage du fuel ne suffisait pas à déterminé sa

condition et/ou sa classification.

Page 1 of 2



GFL Environmental - 747 - GMA - Solid Waste

4 Chemin du Tremblay,

Boucherville, QC

CA  J4B 6Z5

Contact: Steve Voyer

svoyer@matrec.ca

T: 

F: 

Laboratory : WearCheck - C8-1175 Appleby Line, Burlington, ON L7L 5H9

Sample No. : GFL0120764

Lab Number : 02633971

Unique Number : 5775124

Test Package : MOB 1

Received : 07 May 2024

Tested : 07 May 2024

Diagnosed : 07 May 2024 - Kevin Marson

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

Validity of results and interpretation are based on the sample and information as supplied.

Report Id: GFL747 [WCAMIS] 02633971 (Generated: 05/07/2024 16:05:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Steve Voyer - GFL747

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-5775124-4418778&lid=5775124&oem_template=LUBE360
http://www.tcpdf.org

	FREIGHTLINER 8331\Diesel Fuel [GFL0120764] 19 Apr 2024 @ 329670.0 hrs

