
OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

WEAR ---

CONTAMINATION ---

FLUID CONDITION ---
Area

EXPERT DU PNEU MG
Machine Id

GMC 2
Component

Diesel Engine
Fluid

APRIL SUPERFLO RX 1 PASSENGER CARS ENGINE OIL 5W30 (--- GAL)

Report Id: APRTRO [WCAMIS] 02639137 (Generated: 06/21/2024 09:03:21) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: Michel Jalbert - APRTRO

Sample is currently in the laboratory

Page 1 of 2



Sample is currently in the laboratory

Laboratory : WearCheck - C8-1175 Appleby Line, Burlington, ON L7L 5H9

Sample No. : ASF0000203

Lab Number : 02639137

Unique Number : 5788299

Test Package : MOB 2 ( Additional Tests: BottomAnalysis, FILTERPATCH )

Received : 31 May 2024

Tested : 

Diagnosed : 

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

Validity of results and interpretation are based on the sample and information as supplied.

April Super Flo

9 rue Beland

L`Isle-Verte, QC

CA  G0L 1K0

Contact: Michel Jalbert

mjalbert@aprilsuperflo.com

T: 

F: (418)898-2192

Report Id: APRTRO [WCAMIS] 02639137 (Generated: 06/21/2024 09:03:22) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: Michel Jalbert - APRTRO

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-5788299-4428758&lid=5788299&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	GMC GMC 2\Diesel Engine [ASF0000203] 16 May 2024 @ 4200.0 hrs

