
OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

WEAR NORMAL

CONTAMINATION NORMAL

FLUID CONDITION NORMAL

Machine Id

108395-1185
Component

Hydraulic System
Fluid

PETRO CANADA HYDREX XV ALL SEASON HYDRAULIC OIL (--- GAL)

Report Id: GFL756 [WCAMIS] 02641167 (Generated: 06/12/2024 15:59:08) Rev: 1 Submitted By: Eric Beaulieu

Test Limit/AbnUOM Method Current History1 History2
Sample Number Client Info GFL LH0277274 LH
Sample Date Client Info 22 May 2024 04 Jan 2024 20 Jun 2023
Machine Age hrs Client Info 6899 0 5938
Oil Age hrs Client Info 0 0 0
Filter Age hrs Client Info 0 0 0
Oil Changed Client Info Changed Changed Changed
Filter Changed Client Info N/A N/A N/A
Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL

Iron >60ppm ASTM D5185(m) 3 3 3
Chromium >40ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 <1 <1
Nickel >10ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 0 <1
Titanium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 0 0
Silver ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 0 0
Aluminum >5ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 <1 <1
Lead >5ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 0 0
Copper >15ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 <1 <1
Tin >5ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 0 0
Vanadium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 0 0
White Metal NONEscalar Visual* NONE NONE NONE
Yellow Metal NONEscalar Visual* NONE NONE NONE

Silicon >15ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 1 2
Potassium >20ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 <1 <1
Water >0.1WC Method NEG NEG NEG
Particles >4µm >20000ASTM D7647 4361 2350 4966
Particles >6µm >5000ASTM D7647 739 209 1481
Particles >14µm >640ASTM D7647 59 15 110
Particles >21µm >160ASTM D7647 17 5 25
Particles >38µm >40ASTM D7647 2 1 1
Particles >71µm >10ASTM D7647 0 1 0
Oil Cleanliness >21/19/16ISO 4406 (c) 19/17/13 18/15/11 19/18/14
Silt NONEscalar Visual* NONE NONE NONE
Debris NONEscalar Visual* NONE NONE NONE
Sand/Dirt NONEscalar Visual* NONE NONE NONE
Appearance NORMLscalar Visual* NORML NORML NORML
Odor NORMLscalar Visual* NORML NORML NORML
Emulsified Water >0.1scalar Visual* NEG NEG .2%

Sodium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 1 1 <1
Boron 0ppm ASTM D5185(m) 28 32 13
Barium 0ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 0 0
Molybdenum 0ppm ASTM D5185(m) 14 17 20
Manganese 1ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 0 0
Magnesium 0ppm ASTM D5185(m) 268 326 347
Calcium 100ppm ASTM D5185(m) 371 459 432
Phosphorus 670ppm ASTM D5185(m) 666 677 832
Zinc 850ppm ASTM D5185(m) 344 421 545
Sulfur 1600ppm ASTM D5185(m) 1571 1742 1868
Visc @ 40°C 47.9cSt ASTM D7279(m) 48.6 52.0 51.1

RECOMMENDATION

Confirmez la source du lubrifiant utilisé pour l’appoint/remplissage.
Échantillonner de nouveau l`équipement au prochain intervalle de
vidange afin d`en surveiller la condition.

WEAR

Les taux d`usure de tous les composants sont normaux.

CONTAMINATION

La propreté du système est acceptable pour votre objectif de propreté
ISO 4406. La propreté du système et du fluide est acceptable.

FLUID CONDITION

Les niveaux d`additifs indiquent l`ajout d`une autre marque ou d`un
autre type d`huile. L`état de l`huile est acceptable pour la durée de
service.

Page 1 of 2



GFL Environmental - 756 - Quebec Lavoisier MRF

2244 rue Lavoisier
Quebec, QC

CA  G1N 4H2
Contact: Service Manager

T: 
F: 

Laboratory : WearCheck - C8-1175 Appleby Line, Burlington, ON L7L 5H9
Sample No. : GFL
Lab Number : 02641167
Unique Number : 5798706
Test Package : MOB 1 ( Additional Tests: PrtCount )

Received : 11 Jun 2024
Tested : 12 Jun 2024
Diagnosed : 12 Jun 2024 - Kevin Marson

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

Validity of results and interpretation are based on the sample and information as supplied.

Report Id: GFL756 [WCAMIS] 02641167 (Generated: 06/12/2024 15:59:12) Rev: 1 Submitted By: Eric Beaulieu

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-5798706-3325635&lid=5798706&oem_template=LUBE360
http://www.tcpdf.org

	LIEBHERR 108395-1185\Hydraulic System [GFL] 22 May 2024 @ 6899.0 hrs

