
OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

WEAR NORMAL

CONTAMINATION NORMAL

FLUID CONDITION NORMAL

Machine Id

MOLY XL PROSPEC 4 - SETH DAVIS
Component

New (Unused) Oil
Fluid

{not provided} (--- QTS)

Report Id: TEXFOR [WUSCAR] 04398830 (Generated: 06/04/2024 15:37:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SETH DAVIS - TEXFOR

Test Limit/AbnUOM Method Current History1 History2

Sample Number Client Info TR04398830 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 01 Feb 2018 --- ---

Machine Age mls Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Age mls Client Info 0 --- ---

Filter Age mls Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Changed Client Info N/A --- ---

Filter Changed Client Info N/A --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL --- ---

White Metal NONEscalar *Visual NONE --- ---

Yellow Metal NONEscalar *Visual NONE --- ---

Water WC Method NEG --- ---

Silt NONEscalar *Visual NONE --- ---

Debris NONEscalar *Visual NONE --- ---

Sand/Dirt NONEscalar *Visual NONE --- ---

Appearance NORMLscalar *Visual NORML --- ---

Odor NORMLscalar *Visual NORML --- ---

Emulsified Water scalar *Visual NEG --- ---

Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g ASTM D2896 18.15 --- ---

RECOMMENDATION

This is a baseline read-out on the submitted sample.

WEAR

 

CONTAMINATION

 

FLUID CONDITION

 

Page 1 of 2



TEXAS REFINERY CORPORATION

840 NORTH MAIN STREET

FORT WORTH, TX

US  76164

Contact: SETH DAVIS

sdavis@texasrefinery.com

T: (800)827-0711

F: (800)582-3329

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : TR04398830

Lab Number : 04398830

Unique Number : 8082488

Test Package : TEST ( Additional Tests: TBN )

Received : 02 Feb 2018

Tested : 07 Feb 2018

Diagnosed : 07 Feb 2018 - Doug Bogart

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-827-0711.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

Report Id: TEXFOR [WUSCAR] 04398830 (Generated: 06/04/2024 15:37:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SETH DAVIS - TEXFOR

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-8082488-3154383&lid=8082488&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	MOLY XL PROSPEC 4 - SETH DAVIS\New (Unused) Oil [TR04398830] 01 Feb 2018 @ .0 hrs

