
FUEL REPORT

CORROSION NORMAL

CONTAMINANTS SEVERE

FUEL CONDITION ABNORMAL

Machine Id

CHEVROLET 230439309-1 WARD 14 TAHOE
Component

Diesel Fuel
Fluid

{not provided} (--- GAL)

Report Id: NATWINNC [WUSCAR] 05884805 (Generated: 03/27/2024 16:22:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BEN JONES - NATWINNC

Test Limit/AbnUOM Method Current History1 History2

Sample Number Client Info WC05884805 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 26 Jun 2023 --- ---

Machine Age mls Client Info 0 --- ---

Sample Status SEVERE --- ---

Water <0.05% ASTM D6304 0.052 --- ---

ppm Water <500ppm ASTM D6304 527.2 --- ---

RECOMMENDATION

 

CORROSION

 

Page 1 of 2



NATIONAL GENERAL INSURANCE

PO BOX 1623

WINSTON SALEM, NC

US  27102

Contact: BEN JONES

BEN.JONES@NGIC.COM

T: 

F: (800)924-0273

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : WC05884805

Lab Number : 05884805

Unique Number : 10535288

Test Package : MOB 2 ( Additional Tests: KF, PH, SUGAR )

Received : 27 Jun 2023

Tested : 30 Jun 2023

Diagnosed : 30 Jun 2023 - Jonathan Hester

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-237-1369.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

Report Id: NATWINNC [WUSCAR] 05884805 (Generated: 03/27/2024 16:22:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BEN JONES - NATWINNC

Page 2 of 2
Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-10535288-4249674&lid=10535288&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	CHEVROLET CHEVROLET 230439309-1 WARD 14 TAHOE\Diesel Fuel [WC05884805] 26 Jun 2023 @ .0 hrs

