
OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

WEAR ---

CONTAMINATION ---

FLUID CONDITION ---

Area

Store 2 - Beaver [ro#145864]
Machine Id

JOHN DEERE 672G 1DW672GXJLF708537
Component

Rear Axle
Fluid

JOHN DEERE HY-GARD HYD/TRANS (10 GAL)

Report Id: LESMAROH [WUSCAR] 06058360 (Generated: 01/12/2024 15:15:26) Rev: 1 Submitted By: STORE 2 - BEAVER - CASEY TONEY

Sample is currently in the laboratory

Page 1 of 2



Sample is currently in the laboratory

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : LEC0046845

Lab Number : 06058360

Unique Number : 10829742

Test Package : CONST

Recieved : 11 Jan 2024

Diagnosed : 

Diagnostician : 

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-237-1369.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

LESLIE EQUIPMENT COMPANY

105 TENNIS CENTER DR.

MARIETTA, OH

US  45750-9765

Contact: LEANNE KENDALL

KendalLeanne@lec1.com

T: 

F: (740)373-5570

Report Id: LESMAROH [WUSCAR] 06058360 (Generated: 01/12/2024 15:15:26) Rev: 1 Submitted By: STORE 2 - BEAVER - CASEY TONEY

Page 2 of 2
Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-10829742-4350289&lid=10829742&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	JOHN DEERE JOHN DEERE 672G 1DW672GXJLF708537\Rear Axle [LEC0046845] 10 Jan 2024 @ 2517.0 hrs

