
FUEL REPORT

CORROSION ABNORMAL

CONTAMINANTS ABNORMAL

FUEL CONDITION NORMAL

Machine Id

KIOTI YFF100350
Component

Diesel Fuel
Fluid

ON-ROAD (--- GAL)

Report Id: GARCARME [WUSCAR] 06063251 (Generated: 01/29/2024 23:15:57) Rev: 3 Contact/Location: ALBERT BINKS - GARCARME

Test Limit/AbnUOM Method Current History1 History2

Sample Number Client Info KT0000489 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 04 Jan 2024 --- ---

Machine Age hrs Client Info 455 --- ---

Sample Status ABNORMAL --- ---

RECOMMENDATION

Diagnostician`s Note: We were unable to clean and filter the filter element. The

gel has hardened and cured. The material does not dissolve in Toluene, IPA, and

heptane. The gel does not melt but burns. Filter has strong sweet smell. Suspect

that this may be cured industrial spray adhesive or plastic film not removed

before filter was installed. We were unable to load the gel into FTIR pearl to do

an infra-red scan. All tests and evaluation performed at WearCheck Canada.

Magn: 10x Illum: RW

0µ 1000µ

Magn: 60x Illum: RW
0µ 500µ

Page 1 of 2



GARY`S YAMAHA

323 SWEDEN ST

CARIBOU, ME

US  04736

Contact: ALBERT BINKS

binksalbert@gmail.com

T: (207)498-2549

F: 

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : KT0000489

Lab Number : 06063251

Unique Number : 10834633

Test Package : DF-2 ( Additional Tests: Filter )

Recieved : 17 Jan 2024

Diagnosed : 29 Jan 2024

Diagnostician : Doug Bogart

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-237-1369.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

Report Id: GARCARME [WUSCAR] 06063251 (Generated: 01/29/2024 23:15:59) Rev: 3 Contact/Location: ALBERT BINKS - GARCARME

Page 2 of 2
Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-10834633-4366189&lid=10834633&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	KIOTI KIOTI YFF100350\Diesel Fuel [KT0000489] 04 Jan 2024 @ 455.0 hrs

