
FUEL REPORT

CORROSION NORMAL

CONTAMINANTS ABNORMAL

FUEL CONDITION ATTENTION

Machine Id

HC-2205
Component

Diesel Fuel
Fluid

{not provided} (--- GAL)

Report Id: BUCGRA [WUSCAR] 06074279 (Generated: 02/22/2024 10:57:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MICHAEL LAWSON - BUCGRA

Test Limit/AbnUOM Method Current History1 History2

Sample Number Client Info WC0873366 WC0873313 WC0720697

Sample Date Client Info 10 Jan 2024 10 Jan 2024 20 Sep 2022

Machine Age hrs Client Info 7825 7825 6950

Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL

Aluminum <0.1ppm ASTM D5185m <1 0 0

Nickel <0.1ppm ASTM D5185m <1 <1 0

Lead <0.1ppm ASTM D5185m 0 0 0

Vanadium <0.1ppm ASTM D5185m 0 0 0

Iron <0.1ppm ASTM D5185m 0 0 0

Silicon <1.0ppm ASTM D5185m <1 0 0

Sodium <0.1ppm ASTM D5185m <1 <1 0

Potassium <0.1ppm ASTM D5185m 0 0 0

Water <0.05% ASTM D6304 0.003 0.004 0.003

ppm Water <500ppm ASTM D6304 39 43 28.8

Calcium <0.1ppm ASTM D5185m 1 1 <1

Magnesium <0.1ppm ASTM D5185m <1 <1 0

Phosphorus <0.1ppm ASTM D5185m 0 0 2

Zinc <0.1ppm ASTM D5185m 0 0 0

Visc @ 40°C cSt ASTM D445 1.54 2.88 2.46

Sulfur ppm ASTM D5185m 0 0 13

RECOMMENDATION

We advise that you check for the source of water (DEF) entry.

Recommend drain fuel if not already done and flush before refilling with

fuel.

CORROSION

All metal levels are normal indicating no corrosion in the system.

CONTAMINANTS

Excessive free water present. Testing indicates DEF.

FUEL CONDITION

The fuel is no longer serviceable due to the presence of contaminants.

Page 1 of 2



BUCKNER HEAVY LIFT

4732 NC 54 EAST

GRAHAM, NC

US  27253-9215

Contact: MICHAEL LAWSON

michaell@bucknercompanies.com

T: (336)376-8888

F: (336)376-4090

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : WC0873366

Lab Number : 06074279

Unique Number : 10856370

Test Package : CONST ( Additional Tests: Bacteria, COOL, KF )

Received : 30 Jan 2024

Tested : 12 Feb 2024

Diagnosed : 12 Feb 2024 - Doug Bogart

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-237-1369.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

Report Id: BUCGRA [WUSCAR] 06074279 (Generated: 02/22/2024 10:57:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MICHAEL LAWSON - BUCGRA

Page 2 of 2
Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-10856370-4124094&lid=10856370&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	HC-2205\Diesel Fuel [WC0873366] 10 Jan 2024 @ 7825.0 hrs

