
OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

WEAR ---

CONTAMINATION ---

FLUID CONDITION ---

Machine Id

NO INFO ON SIF/BOTTLE
Component

Hydraulic System
Fluid

{not provided} (--- GAL)

Report Id: RWMGAR [WUSCAR] 06237640 (Generated: 07/17/2024 08:21:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RALEIGH SHOP - RWMGAR

Sample is currently in the laboratory

Page 1 of 2



Sample is currently in the laboratory

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : JR0222187

Lab Number : 06237640

Unique Number : 11126474

Test Package : CONST

Received : 16 Jul 2024

Tested : 

Diagnosed : 

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-237-1369.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

JRE - GARNER

4161 AUBURN CHURCH RD

GARNER, NC

US  27529

Contact: RALEIGH SHOP

sean.betts@jamesriverequipment.com;catherine.anastasio@wearcheck.com

T: (919)614-2260

F: (919)779-5432

Report Id: RWMGAR [WUSCAR] 06237640 (Generated: 07/17/2024 08:21:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RALEIGH SHOP - RWMGAR

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-11126474-4450687&lid=11126474&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	NO INFO ON SIF/BOTTLE\Hydraulic System [JR0222187] 15 Jul 2024 @ .0 hrs

