
RAPPORT D'ANALYSE D'HUILE

USURE NORMAL

CONTAMINATION ANORMAL

ÉTAT DU FLUIDE ATTENTION
Secteur

[205941]
Identité de la machine

80039358
Composant

Moteur diesel
Fluide

NOT GIVEN (--- GAL)

ID du rapport: DIEPOI [WCAMIS] 02594793 (Generated: 11/10/2023 13:16:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Karelle Paradis - DIEPOI

Test Limit/AbnUOM Method Current History1 History2

Numéro d'échant. Client Info CU0022110 --- ---

Date d'échant. Client Info 07 Nov 2023 --- ---

Âge d la Machine kms Client Info 783382 --- ---

Âge de l'huile kms Client Info 0 --- ---

Âge du filtre kms Client Info 0 --- ---

Huile changée Client Info Not Changd --- ---

Filtre changé Client Info Not Changd --- ---

Statut de l'échant. ABNORMAL --- ---

Fer >90ppm ASTM D5185(m) 31 --- ---

Chrome >20ppm ASTM D5185(m) 2 --- ---

Nickel >2ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 --- ---

Titane >2ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Argent >2ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 --- ---

Aluminium >20ppm ASTM D5185(m) 9 --- ---

Plomb >40ppm ASTM D5185(m) 2 --- ---

Cuivre >330ppm ASTM D5185(m) 28 --- ---

Étain >15ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Vanadium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 0 --- ---

Silicium >25ppm ASTM D5185(m) 50 --- ---

Potassium >20ppm ASTM D5185(m) 706 --- ---

Essence >3.0% ASTM D7593* <1.0 --- ---

Glycol % ASTM D7922* NEG --- ---

% de suie >6% ASTM D7844* 1.5 --- ---

Nitration >20Abs/cm ASTM D7624* 123.7 --- ---

Sulfatation >30Abs/.1mm ASTM D7415* 20.4 --- ---

Eau émulsifiée >0.2scalar Visual* NEG --- ---

Sodium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 1039 --- ---

Bore ppm ASTM D5185(m) 21 --- ---

Baryum ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 --- ---

Molybdène ppm ASTM D5185(m) 80 --- ---

Manganèse ppm ASTM D5185(m) <1 --- ---

Magnésium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 17 --- ---

Calcium ppm ASTM D5185(m) 95 --- ---

Phosphore ppm ASTM D5185(m) 48 --- ---

Zinc ppm ASTM D5185(m) 160 --- ---

Soufre ppm ASTM D5185(m) 385 --- ---

Oxydation >25Abs/.1mm ASTM D7414* 138.3 --- ---

Visc 100°C cSt ASTM D7279(m) 0.9 --- ---

RECOMMENDATION
This is a baseline read-out on the submitted sample. Diagnostician's
Note: If this is oil present in the coolant reservoir, it is usually quite
difficult to determine the oil type as the coolant changes the chemistry. 
None-the-less the additive levels indicate this is most likely ATF.

USURE
{not applicable}

CONTAMINATION
{not applicable}

ÉTAT DU FLUIDE
{not applicable}

Page 1 sur 2



CUMMINS CANADA ULC
7200 TRANS CANADA HWY.

POINTE CLAIRE, QC
CA  H9R 1C2

Contact: Karelle Paradis
karelle.paradis@cummins.com

T: (514)695-8410
F: (514)695-5246

Laboratoire : WearCheck - C8-1175 Appleby Line, Burlington, ON L7L 5H9
Nº d'échantillon : CU0022110
Nº de laboratoire : 02594793
Numéro unique : 5671872
Analyse : MOB 1 ( Additional Tests: COOL, FuelDilution, Glycol )

Reçu : 08 Nov 2023
Diagnostiqué : 10 Nov 2023
Diagnostiqueur : Bill Quesnel

Pour discuter cetter rapport, contacter le service à la clientèle au 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

La validez de los resultados y la interpretación se basan en la muestra y la información proporcionada.

ID du rapport: DIEPOI [WCAMIS] 02594793 (Generated: 11/10/2023 13:16:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Karelle Paradis - DIEPOI

Page 2 sur 2
Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-5671872-4316079&lid=5671872&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	CUMMINS 80039358\Diesel Engine [CU0022110] 07 Nov 2023 @ 783382.0 hrs

