
11525 Rock Island Court, St. Louis, MO 63043

Tel: 1-800-876-0008 info@englube.com

LABORATORY ANALYSIS

Equipment No. K602
System Natural Gas Compression Engine

Oil Type PETRO CANADA SENTRON LD 3000 (--- LTR)

NuVista Energy

10508 67 Ave, #201

Grande Prairie, AB

CA  T8W 0K8

Contact: Eldon Weaver

eweaver@nvaenergy.com

T: 

F: 

 DIAGNOSIS

The oil is near the end of it`s useful service life,

recommend schedule an oil change. Resample

at the next service interval to monitor.All

component wear rates are normal. The water

content is negligible. There is no indication of

any contamination in the oil. Calcium ppm

levels are abnormally high. The AN level is

acceptable for this fluid.

Customer Id: NUVGRA

Sample No.: PC0085494

Lab Number: 02613136

Test Package: PLANT

To manage this report scan the QR code

To discuss the diagnosis or test data:

Bill Quesnel CLS,OMA II,MLA-III,LLA-I +1

(289)291-4641 x4641

Bill.Quesnel@wearcheck.com

To change component or sample information:

Gloria Gonzalez +1 (289)291-4643 x4643

gloria.gonzalez@wearcheck.com

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Lab Number New 0261-03136 9000-00647 9000-00644

Date of Sample (Typical) 17 Jan 2024 25 Oct 2023 29 Sep 2023

Oil Added UNK UNK UNK

Last Drain Date -- -- --

Months on Sample 0.0 548.0 5477.0

Last Filter Service -- -- --

Sample Point --- --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL

 CONTAMINATION

Water >0.1 NEG NEG NEG

Page 1 of 2

mailto:Bill.Quesnel@wearcheck.com
http://www.oilanalysis.net/pdfreports/pdfs/L\ENGLUBE\EN\0572\OA-RPT-L-5722231-4313517.pdf


OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Report Id: NUVGRA [WCAMIS] 02613136 (Generated: 04/02/2024 11:23:07) Rev: 1 Submitted By: Kris DickmannReport Id: NUVGRA [WCAMIS] 02613136 (Generated: 04/02/2024 11:23:13) Rev: 1 Submitted By: Kris Dickmann

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	CATERPILLAR K602\Natural Gas Compression Engine [PC0085494] 17 Jan 2024 @ 31640.0 hrs

