
11525 Rock Island Court, St. Louis, MO 63043

Tel: 1-800-876-0008 info@englube.com

LABORATORY ANALYSIS

Equipment No. #2 GAS TURBINE (00001)
System Unknown Component

Oil Type SHELL TURBO T ISO 32 (--- GAL)

ASHLEY ENERGY LLC

ONE ASHLEY ST.

ST LOUIS, MO

United States  63102

Contact: Service Manager

T: 

F: 

 DIAGNOSIS

Resample at the next service interval to

monitor. NOTE: Please provide information

regarding reservoir capacity, filter type and

micron rating with next sample. There is a

trace of moisture present in the sample. The

condition of the sample is acceptable for the

time in service.

Customer Id: ENC0133F01

Sample No.: EN23090069

Lab Number: 23090069

Test Package: TEST

To manage this report scan the QR code

To discuss the diagnosis or test data:

Tracy Weaks +1 (314)872-9540

tweaks@englube.com

To change component or sample information:

Tracy Weaks +1 (314)872-9540

tweaks@englube.com

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Lab Number New 2309-00069 2308-01620 ---

Date of Sample (Typical) 05 Sep 2023 30 Aug 2023 ---

Oil Added UNK UNK ---

Last Drain Date -- -- ---

Last Filter Service -- -- ---

Sample Point --- --- ---

Sample Status MARGINAL ATTENTION ---

 % WATER - KARL FISCHER (ASTM E203)

% Water (KF) % 0.118 0.139 ---

ppm Water (KF) ppm 1,180 1,390 ---

Page 1 of 2

mailto:tweaks@englube.com
https://englube.oilanalysis.net/pdfreports/pdfs/L\ENGLUBE\EN\1601\OA-RPT-L-16014571-4276840.pdf


OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Report Id: ENC0133F01 [ENGBAN] 23090069 (Generated: 09/20/2023 12:05:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - ENC0133F01Report Id: ENC0133F01 [ENGBAN] 23090069 (Generated: 09/20/2023 12:05:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - ENC0133F01

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	#2 GAS TURBINE\Unknown Component [EN23090069] 05 Sep 2023 @  hrs

