
11525 Rock Island Court, St. Louis, MO 63043

Tel: 1-800-876-0008 info@englube.com

LABORATORY ANALYSIS

Department SCREW MACHINE

Equipment No. 176 MAZAK 1 (X0009)
System Unknown Component

Oil Type ENGINEERED LUBRICANTS ENCOOL SOL-3250FNF-LF (--- GAL)

EGS MEXICO S DE RL DE CV

VIA MONTERREY MATAMOROS NO 598

MEXICO, ZZ

Mexico  

Contact: Lizbeth Manzanares

Lizbeth.manzanares@emerson.com

T: 

F: 

Customer Id: ENC0005J03

Sample No.: EN23100285

Lab Number: 23100285

Test Package: TEST

To manage this report scan the QR code

To discuss the diagnosis or test data:

 +1

To change component or sample information:

Tracy Weaks +1 (314)872-9540

tweaks@englube.com

Sample is currently in the laboratory

Page 1 of 2

https://www.oilanalysis.net/pdfreports/pdfs/L\ENGLUBE\EN\1602\OA-RPT-L-16025020-4299989.pdf


Sample is currently in the laboratory

Laboratory : WearCheck -

Sample No. : EN23100285

Lab Number : 23100285

Unique Number : 16025020

Test Package : TEST ( Additional Tests: Bacteria, Hardness, RatioRefrac, TrampCuffSediment )

Received : 12 Oct 2023

Diagnosed : 

Diagnostician : 

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

Validity of results and interpretation are based on the sample and information as supplied.

EGS MEXICO S DE RL DE CV

VIA MONTERREY MATAMOROS NO 598

MEXICO, ZZ

Mexico  

Contact: Lizbeth Manzanares

Lizbeth.manzanares@emerson.com

T: 

F: 

Report Id: ENC0005J03 [ENGBAN] 23100285 (Generated: 12/14/2023 11:25:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Lizbeth Manzanares - ENC0005J03

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-16025020-4299989&lid=16025020&oem_template=ENGLUBE
http://www.tcpdf.org

	MAZAK 176 MAZAK 1\Unknown Component [EN23100285] 20 Sep 2023 @  hrs

