
11525 Rock Island Court, St. Louis, MO 63043

Tel: 1-800-876-0008 info@englube.com

LABORATORY ANALYSIS

Department NPI OILS

Equipment No. 1933 CNC MILLING MACHINE (00015)
System Unknown Component

Oil Type ENGINEERED LUBRICANTS ENSPIN 1155-LAW-PF (--- GAL)

WOODWARD CORPORATION

6300 WEST HOWARD STREET

NILES, IL

United States  60714

Contact: Daniel Aviles

daniel.aviles@woodward.com

T: 

F: 

 Diagnosis

All conditions are GREEN. Continue use of oil

and filter element at this time.

Customer Id: ENC0658001

Sample No.: EN24030531

Lab Number: 24030531

Test Package: TEST

To manage this report scan the QR code

To discuss the diagnosis or test data:

Beau Vuagniaux +1

bvuagniaux@englube.com

To change component or sample information:

Tracy Weaks +1 (314)872-9540

tweaks@englube.com

 Sample Information

Lab Number New 2403-00531 2311-00547 2308-00180

Date of Sample (Typical) 14 Mar 2024 16 Nov 2023 03 Aug 2023

Oil Added UNK UNK UNK

Last Drain Date -- -- --

Months on Sample 188.8 185.0 181.7

Last Filter Service -- -- --

Sample Point --- --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL

 ICP - OILS (REPORTED IN PARTS PER MILLION)

Aluminum  (Al) ppm * <5 <5

 Contamination

Water NEG NEG NEG

Page 1 of 2

mailto:bvuagniaux@englube.com
https://englube.oilanalysis.net/pdfreports/pdfs/L\ENGLUBE\EN\1617\OA-RPT-L-16177231-4354001.pdf


OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Report Id: ENC0658001 [ENGBAN] 24030531 (Generated: 05/17/2024 15:00:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Daniel Aviles - ENC0658001

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	MATSUURA 1933 CNC MILLING MACHINE\Unknown Component [EN24030531] 14 Mar 2024 @  hrs

