
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

5.6

HEAT TRANSFER SYSTEM

Customer: PTRHTF10025 System Information Sample Information

LAKESIDE INDUSTRIES

8705 N.E. 117TH AVENUE

VANCOUVER, WA 98662 US

Attn: Chris Merringer

Tel: (360)903-3695

E-Mail:

chris.merringer@lakesideindustries.com

System Volume: 600 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: 325F / 163C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 01849092

Analyst: Michael Kaufman 

Sample Date: 06/13/13

Received Date: 07/08/13

Completed: 07/12/13

Michael Kaufman

mkaufman@suncor.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PETRO-THERM

Make: HEATEC

Recommendation: The oil is showing signs of improvement, probably due to a fluid top-up. The Acid number has decreased from

1.94 in Nov 2012 to 0.76, but we would still consider it high. High acid problems appear to date back to 2007. Acids form as a

result of oxidation and their presence can be corrosive to the system over time. If this sample is representative of what is in the

system, we recommend a partial fluid change-out help bring that acid number down.

Comments: Pentane Insolubles levels are severely high. Acid Number (AN) is severely high. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is

marginally high.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

06/13/13 07/08/13 6.0y RETURN LINE B4 FLTR 448 / 231 47.4 38.4    0.760 1.60 715 / 380 810 / 432 911 / 489 0.94 

11/10/12 11/13/12 437 / 225 93 43.1    1.94 1.833 705 / 374 804 / 429 903 / 484 2.852

02/08/12 02/16/12 4.0y NA 408 / 209 106 41.7    1.51 1.015 705 / 374 803 / 429 898 / 481 3.002

06/21/11 06/30/11 BEFORE FILTER 401 / 205 64 41.3    1.07 0.889 710 / 376 807 / 430 901 / 483 2.54 

06/23/10 07/06/10 3.0y HEATECK 433 / 223 87 42.1    2.03 1.240 700 / 371 799 / 426 890 / 477 3.451

Baseline Data 433 / 223 34.2 0.03 707 / 375 799 / 426 887 / 475 2.6  

Report ID: [01849092] (Generated: 10/09/2023 08:37:38)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2023 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

5.6

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

06/13/13 41 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 3 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

11/10/12 32 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 3 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 3 0

02/08/12 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

06/21/11 3 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 0 1 3 0

06/23/10 3 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 2 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

11/10/12

The rating system is inadequate and therefore falsely ranked this sample as "normal" when in fact this oil is in the "severe" category.  The oxidation level,

measured via the TAN analyis, shows the oil is oxidized way beyond what is tolerable.  Oxidation

02/08/12

The overall oil condition worsened since the last sample from 7 months ago as the Total Acid Number increased from the already high 1.0 to 1.5 today.  High TAN is normally associated with

oxidation, a form of oil degradation.  The high TAN problem dates back as far back as 2007.  if this sample is truly representative of what is circulating in the system an oil replacement should

be considered at some point.  High TAN oil is more corrosive and will attack the piping and over time.  We would rate the sample condition as more critical than the "green" rating it has now.

06/21/11

 

06/23/10

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [01849092] (Generated: 10/09/2023 08:37:38)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2023 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

GCD Spectrum

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

