
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

6.5

4.0 HYDROGENATION                                                                                   

Customer: PTRHTF10093 System Information Sample Information

REC GROUP

3322 ROAD N N.E.

MOSES LAKE, WA 98837 USA

Attn: Sam Bright

Tel: (509)766-8902

E-Mail: sam.bright@recsilicon.com          

                                                                  

System Volume: 50000 gal  

Bulk Operating Temp: 450F / 232C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 01902842

Analyst: Gaston Arseneault 

Sample Date: 03/10/14

Received Date: 03/17/14

Completed: 04/09/14

To discuss this report contact Gaston

Arseneault at 973-986-6503

Fluid: PARATHERM NF

Make: COEN                

Recommendation: Something was wrong with the sampling dates on 2 samples of Paratherm NF, this sample is the oldest

date yet it had the least amount of running hours.  It is possible that some of the flags with the GCD distillation data are caused

by outdated fresh oil values for this oil.  Next time, pls send a sample of fresh Paratherm NF so we can update our system and

make more accurate diagnosis.  Overall the fluid might be showing mild signs of oxidation (high GCD 90%).

Comments: (GCD) % < 335°C is severely high. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is severely high. COC Flash Point is severely

high. (GCD) 10% Distillation Point is marginally low.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

03/10/14 03/17/14 6h FILTRATION UNIT 352 / 178 23.6 18.1    0.040 0.135 558 / 292 670 / 355 786 / 419 34.71

03/07/14 03/26/14 72h FROM FILTRATION UNIT 334 / 168 26.0 18.5    0.038 0.132 553 / 290 667 / 353 782 / 417 36.15

Baseline Data 32 / 0 18.6 0.04 615 / 324 747 / 397 16.42

Report ID: [01902842] (Generated: 02/15/2018 13:49:41)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

6.5

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

03/10/14 17 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 3 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

03/07/14 31 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 5 3 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 1 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

03/07/14

Something was wrong with the sampling dates on 2 samples of Paratherm NF, this sample is the most recent yet it had the oldest date.  It is possible that some of the flags with the GCD distillation data

are caused by outdated fresh oil values for this oil.  Next time, pls send a sample of fresh Paratherm NF so we can update our system and make more accurate diagnosis.  Overall the fluid might be

showing mild signs of oxidation (high GCD 90%).  (GCD) % < 335°C is severely high. COC Flash Point is severely high. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is abnormally high. (GCD) 10% Distillation Point is

marginally low.

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [01902842] (Generated: 02/15/2018 13:49:41)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

