
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

1.6

HEATEC - ABOVE PUMP                                                                                 

Customer: PTRHTF10113 System Information Sample Information

MICHELS PAVING

1547 YOUELL RD

HEBRON, KY 41048 USA

Attn: MIKE H

Tel: (859)647-3139

E-Mail: mikeh@michelsconstruction.com 

                                                                  

System Volume: 400 gal  

Bulk Operating Temp: 345F / 174C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 01949311

Analyst: Ken Humphries 

Sample Date: 09/26/14

Received Date: 10/03/14

Completed: 10/17/14

To discuss this report contact Ken

Humphries at (513)769-4392

Fluid: SHELL THERMIA OIL C

Make: HEATEC              

Recommendation: Sample is beginning to show signs of thermal degregation.  Retest at 6 month interval to see if progression

of breakdown has occurred.  Also, how long has this oil been in service?  Please include this information on the label as it is

critical to help us evaluate product performance.

Comments: COC Flash Point is marginally low. (GCD) 10% Distillation Point is marginally low.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

09/26/14 10/03/14 0y ABOVE PUMP 421 / 216 24.2 47.9    0.18 0.227 723 / 384 860 / 460 963 / 517 3.54 

Baseline Data 500 / 260 64   0.005 777 / 414 867 / 464 964 / 518 0.00 

Report ID: [01949311] (Generated: 01/25/2018 08:20:46)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

1.6

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

09/26/14 6 0 0 0 0 0 1 1 0 0 1 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 5 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

 

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [01949311] (Generated: 01/25/2018 08:20:46)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

