
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

6.0

STEB-BECANCOUR

Customer: PTRHTF30075 System Information Sample Information

McAsphalt

590 ARTHUR-SICARD

BECANCOUR, QC G9H 0P5 CA

Attn: Nicolas Behm

Tel: (819)692-5851

E-Mail: nbehm@mcasphalt.com

System Volume: 35000 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 464F / 240C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02098945

Analyst: Yves Tremblay 

Sample Date: 08/30/16

Received Date: 09/21/16

Completed: 09/28/16

Yves Tremblay

ytremblay154@gmail.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PETRO-THERM

Make: TECHNI FLAMME

Recommendation: Tous les paramètres du fluide caloporteur sont selon les paramètres typiques du fluide PetroTherm.

Reprendre un échantillon à l’intervalle normal.

Comments: 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

08/30/16 09/21/16 27.0m SALLES DES BOUILLOIR 423 / 217 63.4 35.7    0.17 0.166 720 / 382 812 / 433 905 / 485 0.49 

05/29/14 05/30/14 1.0m SAMPLE POINT 444 / 229 0.00 35.0    0.02 0.029 720 / 382 810 / 432 905 / 485 0.47 

Baseline Data 433 / 223 34.2 0.03 720 / 382 817 / 436 900 / 482 1.00 

Report ID: [02098945] (Generated: 05/16/2023 14:00:14)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2023 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

6.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

08/30/16 8 0 0 0 0 53 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

05/29/14 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 3 0 3 1

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

05/29/14

Tous les paramètres sont normaux. L'huile Petro-therm est en très bon état et peut demeurer en service jusqu'au prochain échantillonnage.Nous recommandons

d'échantillonner à nouveau dans 12 mois.

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02098945] (Generated: 05/16/2023 14:00:14)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2023 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

GCD Spectrum

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

