
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

3.2

[DREW@CELANESE] COMPOUNDING PRODEX                                                                

                 Customer: PTRHTF20087 System Information Sample Information

Celanese Eva Performance Poly

4405-101 AVE.

P.O. 428

EDMONTON, AB T5J 2K1 Canada

Attn: Drew MacRae

Tel: (780)468-8383

E-Mail: drew.macrae@celanese.com       

System Volume: 0 ltr  

Bulk Operating Temp: Not Specified

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02126687

Analyst: Gordon Susinski 

Sample Date: 02/07/17

Received Date: 02/09/17

Completed: 01/15/18

To discuss this report contact Gordon

Susinski at (587)582-4118

Fluid: PETRO CANADA CALFLO AF

Make: N/A                 

Recommendation: The TAN result is well above normal limits.  Due to the date of the sample, we request that you resample

the system at your earliest convenience.

Comments: Acid Number (AN) is severely high.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

02/07/17 02/09/17 6m RESERVOIR 399 / 204 62.3 33.1    1.47 0.029 701 / 372 799 / 426 899 / 481 1.30 

08/04/16 08/05/16 0m EXPANSION TANK 426 / 219 0.00 32.8    0.232 0.031 719 / 382 809 / 432 901 / 483 0.35 

01/05/16 01/06/16 0m TANK/DREW @ CELANESE 430 / 221 0.00 32.7    0.26 0.007 692 / 367 790 / 421 881 / 472 1.77 

08/12/15 08/14/15 0m TANK 432 / 222 7.2 32.8    0.25 0.038 701 / 372 801 / 427 900 / 482 0.81 

10/23/14 11/07/14 0m 421 / 216 0.6 32.9    0.18 0.065 689 / 365 781 / 416 896 / 480 0.72 

11/05/13 11/14/13 0m DRAIN 424 / 218 24.4 32.4    0.20 0.170 706 / 374 796 / 425 891 / 477 0.48 

Baseline Data 435 / 224 32.7 0.03 693 / 367 790 / 421 887 / 475 2.5  

Report ID: [02126687] (Generated: 01/15/2018 16:14:29)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

3.2

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

02/07/17 3 0 0 0 3 0 0 0 0 0 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 262 1

08/04/16 0 0 0 0 3 0 0 0 0 0 3 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 277 1

01/05/16 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 8 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 274 0

08/12/15 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 6 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 270 0

10/23/14 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 0 0 0 3 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 264 0

11/05/13 3 0 0 0 1 0 1 0 0 0 3 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 275 1

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 270

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

08/04/16

Results are normal

01/05/16

Results appear normal. Resample at the next interval.

08/12/15

Oil is in good condition, please re-sample at next maintenance interval.I agree with the laboratories interpretation.

10/23/14

Fluid is in good condition, no action is required at this time. Please sample at the next scheduled interval.

11/05/13

We're not certain if an oil change occurred or a just a sweetening becasue the oil is still discolored.  However we noticed the Acid Number has dropped.  No

action needed at this time based o these results.  Everything else looks good too.  Re-sample at next normal interval.

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02126687] (Generated: 01/15/2018 16:14:29)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

