
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

2.0

#3 COOKER (I-854-1-0140)                                                                            

Customer: PTRHTF10156 System Information Sample Information

INGREDION

1515 SOUTH DROVER ST

INDIANAPOLIS, IN 46221 USA

Attn: Devin Wentz

Tel: (317)441-0448

E-Mail: devin.wentz@ingredion.com        

                                                                  

System Volume: 200 gal  

Bulk Operating Temp: 400F / 204C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02145885

Analyst: Yvette Trzcinski 

Sample Date: 05/10/17

Received Date: 05/16/17

Completed: 05/19/17

To discuss this report contact Yvette

Trzcinski at (262)933-0718

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PURITY FG HEAT TRANSFER FLUID

Make: HEAT EXCHANGER/TRAN 

Recommendation: There appears to be slight addition to the system viscosity closer to the Purity FG HTF.  Sediment is low

and flash point remaining constant.  Resample in 3-6 months.

Comments: 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

05/10/17 05/16/17 6m DRAIN PORT 442 / 228 12.9 37.9    0.766 0.033 732 / 389 831 / 444 965 / 518 0.28 

01/10/17 01/23/17 7m 442 / 228 7.6 38.2    0.62 0.026 739 / 393 841 / 449 984 / 529 0.13 

12/09/15 04/19/16 6m HOT OIL HEAT EXCHNGR 450 / 232 9.4 39.0    0.48 0.034 819 / 437 902 / 483 991 / 533 0.00 

07/24/15 08/06/15 0m PAST THE STRAINER 446 / 230 5.2 39.3    0.50 0.037 745 / 396 878 / 470 1007 / 542 0.24 

01/13/15 01/30/15 0m AT PUMP 489 / 254 17.2 44.8    0.109 0.035 894 / 479 942 / 506 1052 / 567 0.09 

Baseline Data 459 / 237 37.12 0.90 721 / 383 807 / 431 892 / 478 1.5  

Report ID: [02145885] (Generated: 02/14/2018 08:18:53)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

2.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

05/10/17 1 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 2 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 188 0

01/10/17 1 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 172 0

12/09/15 4 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 130 6

07/24/15 4 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 134 5

01/13/15 12 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 1 1

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 230

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

01/10/17

The lightening in color, the reduction in viscosity and other properties slowly moving towards Purity FG HTF, we notice the fluid is still a mixture of Interlube and Purity FG HTF at an

approximate ratio of 15% - 85% respectively.  The fluid condition is good with minimal amount of foreign elements, solids and water contamination.  The flash point remains strong.  No

action deemed necessary at this time, just re-sample in 6 months for normal monitoring.  (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is severely high. (GCD) 50% Distillation Point is marginally high.

12/09/15

Considering the sample was submitted much later than it was taken, we recommend to send another set of samples as they were monitored every 4 months

anyways.  The GC profile and additive content still shows high presence of Interlube.  The oil condition is suitable for further service.  (GCD) 10% Distillation Point

is severely high. (GCD) 50% Distillation Point is severely high. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is severely high.

07/24/15

Some of the properties are flagged because they are compared to fresh Purity FG HTF and doesn't consider the system is a mixture of about 50/50 with Interlube.  There is a

steady change in properties to show the increasing amount of Purity FG HTF in the system.  The overall condition of the fluid appears to be good based on the results with metals,

water and insoluble solids at low levels.  Please re-sample at next scheduled interval.  (GCD) 50% Distillation Point is severely high. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is severely high.

01/13/15

Sample is showing signs of oxidation (high GCD & viscosity values) which will lead to less effcient service of the system and sludge build-up. It is also possible

that the fluid has some contamination with a lower viscosity fluid. Re-sample in 6 months to monitor the fluid health.  (GCD) 10% Distillation Point is severely high.

(GCD) 50% Distillation Point is severely high. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is severely high. COC Flash Point is abnormally high. Visc @ 40°C is abnormally high.

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02145885] (Generated: 02/14/2018 08:18:53)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

