
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

2.9

TFS H/O SYSTEM #1                                                                                   

Customer: PTRHTF10176 System Information Sample Information

CERTAINTEED ROOFING

100 CERTAINTEED DR

JONESBURG, MO 63351 USA

Attn: Brad Van Sickle

Tel: (636)235-8794

E-Mail: brad.vansickle@saint-gobain.com

                                                                  

System Volume: 4462 gal  

Bulk Operating Temp: 525F / 274C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02180912

Analyst: Gaston Arseneault 

Sample Date: 10/27/17

Received Date: 11/08/17

Completed: 11/27/17

To discuss this report contact Gaston

Arseneault at 973-986-6503

Fluid: PETRO CANADA CALFLO AF

Make: FSE                 

Recommendation: While the flash point appears to have gone up a bit, the viscosity dropped slightly, showing the

unpredictability of the flash point test.  The oil condition shows We recommend to perform some venting of this fluid by sending

the vapors to the expansion tank and replenish the losses with fresh oil.  This should help restore both the viscosity and the

flash point closer to fresh oil values.

Comments: COC Flash Point is marginally low.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

10/27/17 11/08/17 2y 374 / 190 18.1 27.7    0.01 0.034 696 / 369 786 / 419 889 / 476 0.00 

04/20/17 05/01/17 2y STRAINER MAIN PUMP 342 / 172 102.6 28.2    0.06 0.081 680 / 360 792 / 422 895 / 479 3.99 

03/15/17 04/05/17 2y STRAINER NR MAIN PMP 363 / 184 13.9 27.0    0.081 0.028 683 / 361 794 / 423 901 / 483 3.92 

Baseline Data 435 / 224 32.7 0.03 693 / 367 790 / 421 887 / 475 2.5  

Report ID: [02180912]  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2017 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

2.9

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

10/27/17 1 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 84 0

04/20/17 7 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 87 0

03/15/17 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 57 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 270

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

04/20/17 The sample has a bit more metals and solids but looks much darker, completely black, compared to the previous sample a month prior.  maybe due to the

03/15/17 The fluid viscosity is starting to drop although it's not bad enough to be flagged.  This combined with the slightly reduced flash point indicate that there is a bit of

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Suncor Energy Inc is the proud owner of Petro-Canada.

Report ID: [02180912]  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2017 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

