
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

[CRESCENT POINT ENERGY / 13-19-6-9W2] SEEP HOT OIL SYSTEM                              

                                                  Customer: PTRHTF20180 System Information Sample Information

CRESCENT POINT ENERGY

801 RAILWAY AVE W

CARLYLE, SK S0C 0R0 Canada

Attn: Jared Garnier

Tel: 

E-Mail:

jgarnier@crescentpointenergy.com          

System Volume: 15000 ltr  

Bulk Operating Temp: 366F / 186C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02186972

Analyst: Kevin McDermott 

Sample Date: 12/04/17

Received Date: 12/08/17

Completed: 12/12/17

To discuss this report contact Kevin

McDermott at (403)215-7052

Fluid: CHEVRON HEAT TRANSFER OIL 46

Make: GTS                 

Recommendation: Fluid remains in very good condition.  Very little change since the January 24, 2017 sample.  Suggest to

continue with annual sampling.

Comments: 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

12/04/17 12/08/17 27m 450 / 232 25.1 40.4    0.015 0.040 740 / 393 841 / 449 935 / 502 0.00 

01/24/17 01/27/17 18m PROCESS REBOILER BD 448 / 231 5.4 41.2    0.21 0.028 740 / 393 838 / 448 937 / 503 0.00 

Baseline Data 464 / 240 41.1      739 / 393 836 / 447 941 / 505 0.8  

Report ID: [02186972] (Generated: 12/15/2017 10:38:21)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2017 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

12/04/17 9 2 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 1 0 0 0 1 0

01/24/17 18 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 1

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

01/24/17

Fluid is in excellent condition.  To be proactive suggest submitting samples annually or sooner but only if system conditions become severe.

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02186972] (Generated: 12/15/2017 10:38:21)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2017 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

