
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

DUPLEX FILTER                                                                                       

Customer: PTRHTF10028 System Information Sample Information

PPG AEROSPACE

11601 UNITED ST

MOJAVE, CA 93501 USA

Attn: Fernando Saldana

Tel: (661)232-6814

E-Mail: fsaldana@ppg.com                       

                                                                  

System Volume: 12 gal  

Bulk Operating Temp: 570F / 299C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02201830

Analyst: Steven Slanker 

Sample Date: 02/19/18

Received Date: 03/02/18

Completed: 03/07/18

To discuss this report contact Steven

Slanker at (951)225-2115

Fluid: PETRO CANADA CALFLO AF

Make:                     

Recommendation: Slightly low Flash Point and initial boiling point but suitable for continued use.

Comments: 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

02/19/18 03/02/18 0c 385 / 196 19.5 29.1    0.18 0.085 675 / 357 791 / 422 893 / 479 4.80 

07/18/16 07/22/16 0c BACK SIDE OF FILTER 370 / 188 8.2 30.1    0.296 0.077 678 / 359 785 / 419 896 / 480 3.48 

Baseline Data 435 / 224 32.7 0.03 693 / 367 790 / 421 887 / 475 2.5  

Report ID: [02201830] (Generated: 03/08/2018 10:05:53)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

02/19/18 29 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 3 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 106 1

07/18/16 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 93 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 270

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

07/18/16

The acid number is on the high side and the flash point is marginally low.  It is expect that these numbers will continue to degrade over time. Recommend

cleaning and changing out the system as previously discussed at the end of the year.  Acid Number (AN) is abnormally high. COC Flash Point is marginally low.

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02201830] (Generated: 03/08/2018 10:05:53)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

