
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

TOURMALINE BANSHEE 5500-1                                                                           

Customer: PTRHTF20046 System Information Sample Information

QUADRA CHEMICALS

12925 146TH STREET

EDMONTON, AB T5L 2H6 CANADA

Attn: Ada Aponte

Tel: 

E-Mail: Ada_Aponte@quadra.ca              

                                                                  

System Volume: 20000 ltr  

Bulk Operating Temp: 482F / 250C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02203575

Analyst: Peter Harteveld 

Sample Date: 03/06/18

Received Date: 03/13/18

Completed: 03/17/18

To discuss this report contact Peter

Harteveld at (780)967-4234

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PETRO-THERM

Make:                     

Recommendation: The fluid is in excellent condition and suitable for further use. Please re-sample in 12 months and rectify

fluid service life at that time.

Comments: 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

03/06/18 03/13/18 662y 439 / 226 0.2 35.8    0.01 0.098 706 / 374 798 / 426 892 / 478 0.00 

02/23/17 03/03/17 0y 421 / 216 7.1 35.7    0.100 0.117 704 / 373 805 / 429 915 / 490 0.43 

12/09/15 12/14/15 2y 473 / 245 36.8 35.1    0.05 0.049 701 / 372 803 / 429 905 / 485 1.06 

07/29/14 08/06/14 5y 448 / 231 401.2 34.9    0.063 0.053 691 / 366 800 / 426 918 / 492 1.75 

02/19/14 03/13/14 18y 433 / 223 22.2 35.0    0.053 0.126 707 / 375 813 / 434 924 / 496 1.21 

Baseline Data 433 / 223 34.2 0.03 720 / 382 817 / 436 900 / 482 1.00 

Report ID: [02203575] (Generated: 03/17/2018 10:34:21)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

03/06/18 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

02/23/17 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

12/09/15 4 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

07/29/14 8 0 0 0 0 1 0 1 0 0 2 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 1 1

02/19/14 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

02/23/17

The fluid is in good condition and suitable for further use. Please re-sample in 12 months.

12/09/15

The fluid is in excellent condition. Please re-sample in 12 months.

07/29/14

The fluid is in good condition. Water content is elevated but not alarming. The difference in water content compared with the sample taken in February 2014 is however large. Please check for source

of water. It is recommended to vent off the water vapor via thief hatch. This is most efficient with blanket gas removed but should be done only a few hours at a time to avoid the fluid from oxidizing in

contact with outside air at high temperature. Water contamination levels are marginally high. Water contamination levels are marginally high.. ppm Water contamination levels are marginally high.

02/19/14

The fluid is in good condition and suitable for further use.GCD 90% temperature is slightly elevated indicating some oxidation is taking place.It is recommended to

re-sample in 6 months time.  (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is marginally high.

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02203575] (Generated: 03/17/2018 10:34:21)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

