
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

ACIPCO WEST 2016                                                                                    

Customer: PTRHTF10182 System Information Sample Information

American Cast Iron Pipe Co.

2930 NO 16th St.

Birmingham, AL 35207 USA

Attn: Jeremy Mowry

Tel: (205)325-7905

E-Mail: jmowry@american-usa.com         

                                                                  

System Volume: 5875 gal  

Bulk Operating Temp: Not Specified

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02218013

Analyst: Manny Garcia 

Sample Date: 02/01/16

Received Date: 05/24/18

Completed: 05/25/18

To discuss this report contact Manny

Garcia at 954-384-7259

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PETRO-THERM

Make: WUERZ               

Recommendation: Fluid is suitable for continued use.  Please include the age of the fluid and the age of the system on the

label during May of 2019 annual sample submission.  Light debris can be filtered during an appropriate time and if there are

any system filters, please schedule them for a change-out

Comments: Light debris noticed in fluid sample

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

02/01/16 05/24/18 0h 21.9 35.3    0.02 0.035 690 / 365 799 / 426 909 / 487 4.00 

Baseline Data 433 / 223 34.2 0.03 720 / 382 817 / 436 900 / 482 1.00 

Report ID: [02218013] (Generated: 05/29/2018 12:39:17)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

02/01/16 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 1

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

 

 

 

 

 

Report ID: [02218013] (Generated: 05/29/2018 12:39:17)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

