
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

10.0

[TANGLE CREEK ENERGY 02-26-52-12W5M] HEAT TRANSFER

Customer: PTRHTF20201 System Information Sample Information

TANGLE CREEK ENERGY

2-26-52-12W5M

WHITECOURT, AB T7S 0A2 Canada

Attn: Jason Kerr

Tel: (780)706-1778

E-Mail: jkerr@tanglecreekenergy.com      

                                                                  

System Volume: 1200 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: 374F / 190C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02228658

Analyst: Peter Harteveld 

Sample Date: 06/28/18

Received Date: 07/17/18

Completed: 08/14/18

To discuss this report contact Peter

Harteveld at (780)967-4234

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PETRO-THERM

Make: 

Recommendation: The fluid is severely degraded and has to be replaced. The viscosity is very high. AN has exceeded the limit. The oil has become corrosive

and therefore the Fe content is high. GCD 90% temperature is slightly low. The symptoms indicate degradation by oxidation. The Pentane Insoluble (solids)

content has exceeded the reportable limit of 0.5% Since oxidation is usually caused by hot oil contacting atmospheric air, it is advised to check proper operation

of the blanket gas system.Before filling with fresh fluid an internal inspection of the heater is recommended. This because the solids content is at 0.749%. If

necessary the system needs to be cleaned/flushed prior adding a fresh fill. Please take a sample of the fresh fill in circulation while cold and another sample of

hot fluid after 24 hours of service. The results will be used as baseline references. For further questions please contact your Petro-Canada Tech Service Advisor.

Comments: Iron ppm levels are severe. PQ levels are severe. Pentane Insolubles levels are severely high. Acid Number (AN) is severely high. Visc @ 40°C is

severely high. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is marginally low.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

06/28/18 07/17/18 0h BOTTOM OF THE PUMP 406 / 208 263.9 238     2.09 0.749 714 / 379 779 / 415 881 / 472 0.00 

Baseline Data 433 / 223 34.2 0.03 720 / 382 817 / 436 900 / 482 1.00 

Report ID: [02228658] (Generated: 08/14/2018 18:56:28)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

10.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

06/28/18 1429 1 0 7 0 0 0 0 0 0 10 12 0 0 0 0 17 0 0 2 4 0 1 1

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

 

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02228658] (Generated: 08/14/2018 18:56:28)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

