
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

UNIT 5013

Customer: PTRHTF10082 System Information Sample Information

JASPER RUBBER

1010 FIRST AVE

JASPER, IN 47546 USA

Attn: MIKE ACKERMAN

Tel: (812)482-6666

E-Mail: mike@ackoil.com                         

                                                                  

System Volume: 600 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: 424F / 218C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02229332

Analyst: Joe Goecke 

Sample Date: 07/12/18

Received Date: 07/19/18

Completed: 07/21/18Fluid: PETRO CANADA CALFLO AF

Make: KONUS

Recommendation: Oil looks great with little degradation, continue to use. Sample at next interval.

Comments: 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

07/12/18 07/19/18 59371h 401 / 205 8.0 41.3    0.065 0.035 695 / 368 793 / 423 891 / 477 1.54 

07/03/17 07/28/17 50513h 430 / 221 9.8 30.1    0.01 0.037 692 / 367 793 / 423 892 / 478 1.95 

12/28/16 01/03/17 46028h 412 / 211 9.9 30.2    0.056 0.035 693 / 367 801 / 427 910 / 488 2.02 

07/30/16 08/19/16 41721h 390 / 199 12.2 24.0    0.08 0.035 692 / 367 790 / 421 886 / 475 1.49 

08/01/15 08/13/15 33001h 415 / 213 0.00 30.4    0.11 0.038 696 / 369 804 / 429 932 / 500 1.62 

01/08/15 01/12/15 0h 419 / 215 7.7 30.8    0.01 0.017 703 / 373 815 / 435 907 / 486 1.34 

Baseline Data 435 / 224 32.7 0.03 693 / 367 790 / 421 887 / 475 2.5  

Report ID: [02229332] (Generated: 08/01/2019 11:23:46)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2019 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

07/12/18 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 32 0

07/03/17 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 4 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 0 0 0 42 0

12/28/16 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 43 0

07/30/16 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 40 0

08/01/15 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 44 0

01/08/15 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 44 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 270

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

07/03/17

Analysis looks good, no action required resample at next interval.

12/28/16

Current system looks to be in good condition.  Continue to operate and resample at normal interval.  (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is marginally high.

07/30/16

Viscosity low, Flash point below 200, GCD<335 low.  Resample at half normal frequency or consider changing part of fluid to increase viscosity and flash point

08/01/15

This sample is in good condition and suitable for further use. Sample again at next maintenance interval.

01/08/15

No issues with this sample. Re-sample at next maintenance interval.

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02229332] (Generated: 08/01/2019 11:23:46)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2019 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

GCD Spectrum

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

