
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

HEAT TRANSFER SYSTEM

Customer: PTRHTF40090 System Information Sample Information

QUICKLY BEST SELLERS BV

AKKEKSE WEG 136

MEDEL,  5321M6 NETHERLANDS

Attn: Maintenance Manager

Tel: NA

E-Mail: 

System Volume: 3500 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 270F / 132C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02237351

Analyst: Philip Riley 

Sample Date: 08/28/18

Received Date: 09/04/18

Completed: 09/10/18

To discuss this report contact Philip Riley

at (440)124-4378171

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PURITY FG HEAT TRANSFER FLUID

Make: MAXXTEC

Recommendation: All parameters within allowable limits. Some light ends present but COC unaffected. Based on sample

results fluid fit for further use

Comments: 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

08/28/18 09/04/18 12y 419 / 215 40.1 39.1    0.80 0.321 721 / 383 812 / 433 897 / 481 0.08 

09/19/17 09/22/17 11y 419 / 215 23.0 38.9    0.87 0.559 718 / 381 814 / 435 897 / 481 1.42 

10/04/16 10/11/16 10y 423 / 217 467.2 39.5    1.11 0.338 721 / 383 818 / 437 899 / 482 1.04 

03/06/15 03/12/15 9y 415 / 213 12.0 39.8    0.78 0.075 720 / 382 819 / 437 902 / 483 1.65 

01/31/14 02/07/14 8y PTRHTF40090 423 / 217 41.1 38.6    0.95 0.356 718 / 381 820 / 438 903 / 484 1.73 

09/06/11 09/09/11 444 / 229 44 37.7    0.26 0.014 719 / 382 816 / 435 902 / 483 1.773

Baseline Data 459 / 237 37.12 0.90 721 / 383 807 / 431 892 / 478 1.5  

Report ID: [02237351] (Generated: 09/10/2018 04:08:25)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

08/28/18 10 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 82 8

09/19/17 20 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 93 3

10/04/16 7 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 100 2

03/06/15 3 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 108 0

01/31/14 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 107 1

09/06/11 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 3 0 0 0 0 4 1 11 0 107 7

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 230

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

09/19/17

Beware of the insoluble matter that is creeping up, all other parameters look OKAn increase in the iron level is noted. All other component wear rates are normal.

Pentane Insolubles levels are abnormally high.

10/04/16

Unusual amount of water detected. Could be condensation from sample  - check where water may have ingress. Oil appears to be in good condition and fit for

further service. Water contamination levels are marginally high. Water contamination levels are marginally high.. ppm Water contamination levels are marginally

high.

03/06/15

Oil appears to be in very good condition.Suggest resample at next scheduled maintenance interval.

01/31/14

Oil appears to be in very good condition.Sample at next scheduled maintenance service.

09/06/11

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02237351] (Generated: 09/10/2018 04:08:25)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

