
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

1.0

INCINERATOR SYSTEM

Customer: PTRHTF10069 System Information Sample Information

CERTAINTEED - SAINT GOBAIN

3303 EAST 4TH AVENUE

SHAKOPEE, MN 55379 USA

Attn: Patrick Wallace

Tel: 

E-Mail: patrick.wallace@saint-

gobain.com                                               

System Volume: 3000 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: 550F / 288C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02244122

Analyst: Gaston Arseneault 

Sample Date: 09/30/18

Received Date: 10/10/18

Completed: 10/23/18

Gaston Arseneault

gaston.arseneault@hollyfrontier.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA CALFLO AF

Make: JOHN ZINK

Recommendation: Everything looks normal.  Re-sample at next scheduled interval.  No trace of contamination by asphalt or the

elements or fluid degradation.

Comments: 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

09/30/18 10/10/18 0.0y 410 / 210 6.2 30.5    0.05 0.032 703 / 373 795 / 424 892 / 478 0.00 

09/06/17 09/12/17 4.0y MAIN SYSTEM FLOW 410 / 210 14.4 30.1    0.238 0.039 697 / 369 794 / 424 892 / 478 1.56 

05/14/16 05/24/16 0.0y MAIN SYSTEM FLOW 410 / 210 5.6 30.5    0.248 0.042 699 / 371 796 / 424 882 / 472 1.28 

04/15/15 05/07/15 0.0y MN FLOW/MN SYS PUMP 442 / 228 5.0 30.5    0.14 0.305 703 / 373 799 / 426 896 / 480 0.48 

Baseline Data 435 / 224 32.7 0.03 693 / 367 790 / 421 887 / 475 2.5  

Report ID: [02244122] (Generated: 05/12/2021 15:30:51)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2021 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

1.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

09/30/18 6 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 56 0

09/06/17 12 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 58 0

05/14/16 14 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 61 0

04/15/15 19 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 73 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 270

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

09/06/17

The oil condition is consistent with previous samples.  Nothing is flagged whatsoever.  No immediate action is required at this time.  Re-sample at next normal

interval.

05/14/16

Sample looks good and fit for further service. Resample next interval to monitor.

04/15/15

Pentane insoluble level is at 0.305% and higher than a typical used oil sample of <0.05%. Continue to monitor and the condemning limit is >0.5%. All other

properties are within normal ranges.

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02244122] (Generated: 05/12/2021 15:30:51)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2021 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

GCD Spectrum

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

