
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

10.0

[TIDEWATER MIDSTREAM LSD / 11-33-45-8W5M] TRAIN A

Customer: PTRHTF20006 System Information Sample Information

Tidewater

21 Oxford Pl.

Alder Flats, AB T0C 0A0 Canada

Attn: Travis Smith

Tel: (780)679-2498

E-Mail: tsmith@tidewatermidstream.com 

                                                                  

System Volume: 6000 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 266F / 130C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02253876

Analyst: Terry Veenstra 

Sample Date: 11/20/18

Received Date: 11/27/18

Completed: 12/10/18Fluid: PETRO CANADA PETRO-THERM

Make: 

Recommendation: This sample shows severe water contamination. GCD @ 10%, 50% and 90% are also severely low

indicating possible contamination with process fluids. Vent off moisture in high point vent or in expansion tank.

Comments: Water contamination levels are severely high. Water contamination levels are severely high.. ppm Water

contamination levels are severely high. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is severely low. (GCD) 10% Distillation Point is

abnormally low. (GCD) 50% Distillation Point is abnormally low. (GCD) % < 335°C is marginally high.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

11/20/18 11/27/18 8y 439 / 226 6172.4 34.1    0.07 0.064 636 / 335 733 / 389 834 / 445 9.40 

04/10/18 04/18/18 7y 417 / 214 8.1 34.1    0.08 0.251 705 / 374 813 / 434 928 / 498 2.34 

08/22/17 08/28/17 7y HEATER BATH 423 / 217 16.7 26.3    0.02 0.250 707 / 375 809 / 432 904 / 485 1.88 

11/01/16 11/08/16 6y 433 / 223 184.4 33.3    0.137 0.107 708 / 376 811 / 433 909 / 487 1.71 

09/09/16 09/14/16 6y HEATER BATH 397 / 203 34.2 32.0    0.375 0.217 697 / 370 803 / 428 894 / 479 2.97 

08/25/15 09/02/15 5y HEATER BATH 415 / 213 54.6 32.5    0.26 0.138 696 / 369 806 / 430 902 / 484 3.07 

Baseline Data 433 / 223 34.2 0.03 720 / 382 817 / 436 900 / 482 1.00 

Report ID: [02253876] (Generated: 12/10/2018 18:02:09)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

10.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

11/20/18 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

04/10/18 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

08/22/17 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

11/01/16 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

09/09/16 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

08/25/15 3 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

04/10/18

GCD @ 90% is high indicating some heavier ends in sample likely caused by overheating of fluid. Otherwise oil is still in good shape. Continue to operate and

resample in 6 - 8 months.  (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is abnormally high.

08/22/17

Fluid condition continues to be very good.  Very little change from the last sample Nov 2016.  Continue to sample annually to proactively monitor fluid condition.

11/01/16

This oil sample look good. The oil is suitable for further use.

09/09/16

Acid number is higher than it should be however oil is good for continued use. Resample in 3 months.  Acid Number (AN) is abnormally high.

08/25/15

Fluid condition remains very good.  Continue with annual sample submissions to monitor fluid condition.

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02253876] (Generated: 12/10/2018 18:02:09)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

