
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

4.0

[ / 7-11-064-03W6 / ] HEATER 2

Customer: PTRHTF20207 System Information Sample Information

SEVEN GENERATIONS ENERGY LTD

7-11-064-03W6

GRANDE PRAIRIE, AB T8V 8H7

Canada

Attn: Justin Dery

Tel: (587)435-4480

E-Mail: justin.dery@7genenergy.com       

System Volume: 140000 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 320F / 160C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02255771

Analyst: Clinton Buhler 

Sample Date: 11/27/18

Received Date: 12/07/18

Completed: 12/17/18Fluid: CHEVRON HEAT TRANSFER OIL 46

Make: PETRO TECH

Recommendation: Sample results indicate that the heat transfer fluid is suitable for continued service. Please note reduced flash point and increased % boil-

off (GCD % < 335C). That, and also the fluid's viscosity is 30.8 cSt vs 41cSt of new fluid can indicate a mixture of different fluids, but it can also indicate

thermal degradation.Depending on system design, that is, if a high blanket gas pressure is not required to provide the circulation pumps positive suction

head pressure, it is recommended to perform regular venting of the expansion tank to remove the low boiling vapors from the system. This can help restore

distillation values as well as flash point. Water level is not ideal. This may be an indication of where the sample was drawn from. Venting will also assist in

removing water from the system if results are representative. Once venting (if safe to do so) has been completed thoroughly, please re-sample in 6 months.

Comments: Water contamination levels are marginally high. COC Flash Point is abnormally low. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is marginally low.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

11/27/18 12/07/18 1w 374 / 190 475.0 30.8    0.028 0.096 718 / 381 828 / 442 918 / 492 4.17 

Baseline Data 464 / 240 41.1      739 / 393 836 / 447 941 / 505 0.8  

Report ID: [02255771] (Generated: 12/19/2018 10:29:09)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

4.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

11/27/18 7 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 11 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 2 0 0 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

 

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02255771] (Generated: 12/19/2018 10:29:09)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

