
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

9.6

HOT OIL HEATER ABQ-1

Customer: PTRHTF10213 System Information Sample Information

HOLLY FRONTIER ASPHALT

4949 EDITH BLVD N.E.

ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87107 USA

Attn: Luis A Contreras

Tel: (316)323-4680

E-Mail: luis.contreras@hollyfrontier.com  

                                                                  

System Volume: 650 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: Not Specified

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02267070

Analyst: Matthew Hoeffner 

Sample Date: 10/18/18

Received Date: 02/11/19

Completed: 02/26/19Fluid: MONSANTO THERMINOL 55

Make: INDUSTRIAL COMBUSTIO

Recommendation: Fluid acid number is very high as well as the pentane insoluble indicating a severely degraded fluid.  The

fluid appears to have been topped off with a different chemistry than the Therminol 55 believed to be present.  To prevent

issues with operations and reliability of the system going forward planning should begin for cleaning the system and refilling

with fresh fluid.

Comments: 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

10/18/18 02/11/19 15y TK151 COIL DRAIN VAL 421 / 216 108.5 44.9    1.42 3.48 649 / 343 754 / 401 879 / 470 6.21 

Baseline Data 349 / 176 19.0 0.03 655 / 346 790 / 421 3.40 

Report ID: [02267070] (Generated: 02/26/2019 13:19:32)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2019 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

9.6

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

10/18/18 103 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 120 0 4 2

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

 

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02267070] (Generated: 02/26/2019 13:19:32)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2019 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

