
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.8

KONUS BURNER

Customer: System Information Sample Information

EACOM TIMBER CORPORATION

PO BOX 9

1 SIXTH ST

ELK LAKE, ON P0J 1G0 Canada

Attn: Robert Mailloux

Tel: (705)678-2110

E-Mail: robert.mailloux@eacom.ca           

System Volume: 10000 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: Not Specified

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02269087

Analyst: Bill Quesnel CLS,OMA II,MLA-

III,LLA-I 

Sample Date: 10/22/18

Received Date: 02/21/19

Completed: 03/18/19

Fluid: MOBIL THERMOIL 46

Make: KONUS BURNER

Recommendation: Resample at the next service interval to monitor.

Comments: (GCD) 10% Distillation Point is marginally high. The condition of the fluid is suitable for further service.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

10/22/18 02/21/19 0y 2018-0019443 410 / 210 88.0 44.3    0.231 0.154 743 / 395 849 / 454 966 / 519 0.55 

12/11/17 12/27/17 0y 370 / 188 18.8 45.9    0.05 0.112 709 / 376 803 / 428 908 / 487 0.00 

10/22/16 10/27/16 0y 356 / 180 60.5 45.6    0.04 0.149 719 / 382 852 / 455 978 / 525 3.58 

Baseline Data 414 / 212 46        709 / 376 824 / 440 961 / 516

Report ID: [02269087] (Generated: 03/18/2019 13:12:53)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2019 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.8

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

10/22/18 58 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 12 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 1 5 0 3 9

12/11/17 11 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 2

10/22/16 48 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 10 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 4 0 2 6

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

12/11/17

The fluid is suitable for further service. Resample at the next service interval to monitor.  (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is abnormally low, however, all other

parameters are acceptable.

10/22/16

The flash point is marginally lower than expected.  You may wish to vent off any light ends in an attempt to correct the flash point.  Resample at the next normal

interval (typically one year).  (GCD) 50% Distillation Point is marginally high. COC Flash Point is marginally low.

 

 

 

WearCheck Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability

whatsoever with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it.

Report ID: [02269087] (Generated: 03/18/2019 13:12:53)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2019 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

