
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

6.0

MEYN FULTON BOILER

Customer: PTRHTF30126 System Information Sample Information

MAPLE LEAF FOODS

333 COURTNEYPARK DR E

MISSISSAUGA, ON L5T 2T6 Canada

Attn: James Budan Hughes

Tel: (905)565-9388

E-Mail:

james.budanhughes@mapleleaf.com      

System Volume: 0 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 650F / 343C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02270617

Analyst: Lynn Billings 

Sample Date: 02/24/19

Received Date: 02/28/19

Completed: 03/05/19Fluid: PARATHERM NF

Make: FULTON THERMAL CORP

Recommendation: The GCD definitely has picked up low boiling material so suspect thermal cracking as well as oxidation. 

The viscosity has increased as well which indicates oxidation (sludge and carbon).  This sludge and carbon will deposit within

the system.

Comments: (GCD) % < 335°C is severely high. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is severely high.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

02/24/19 02/28/19 10y Y STAINET BLOW DOWN 324 / 162 0.00 24.2    0.044 0.048 562 / 294 663 / 351 789 / 421 35.83

Baseline Data 345 / 174 18.6 0.04 615 / 324 747 / 397 16.42

Report ID: [02270617] (Generated: 03/05/2019 15:57:03)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2019 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

6.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

02/24/19 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

 

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02270617] (Generated: 03/05/2019 15:57:03)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2019 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

