
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

1.6

WANSON EPC 2500 ES

Customer: PTRHTF40020 System Information Sample Information

LE DUC FINE FOOD BV

MEESTER SNIJDERWEG 18

ZUID-HOLLAND

STELLENDAM, ZUI  NETHERLANDS

Attn: Wilbert Snijers

Tel: 

E-Mail: w.snijers@klt.nl                             

System Volume: 1500 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 265F / 129C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02281302

Analyst: Philip Riley 

Sample Date: 04/16/19

Received Date: 04/24/19

Completed: 05/07/19Fluid: PETRO CANADA PURITY FG HEAT TRANSFER FLUID

Make: WANSON

Recommendation: COC Flash Point trending downwards, and must show caution. If it can be recovered safely through any form

of venting (although no great volume of light molecules look to be present) if would be worth doing to potentially extend the life of

the fluid.

Comments: Iron ppm levels are noted.  COC Flash Point is abnormally low.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

04/16/19 04/24/19 0y 354 / 179 29.0 30.7    0.23 0.192 699 / 370 799 / 426 893 / 479 3.56 

09/28/18 10/04/18 0y 378 / 192 23.8 28.5    0.20 0.236 699 / 370 796 / 425 889 / 476 3.58 

08/30/18 09/04/18 4y 309 / 154 24.5 28.7    0.19 0.115 684 / 362 798 / 426 898 / 481 5.26 

01/31/18 02/12/18 3y 324 / 162 19.3 29.3    0.24 0.037 732 / 389 814 / 434 905 / 485 0.07 

05/31/17 06/02/17 0y 324 / 162 13.3 30.2    0.29 0.329 694 / 368 808 / 431 906 / 485 4.53 

11/30/16 12/08/16 27y 367 / 186 20.8 30.8    0.41 0.316 703 / 373 811 / 433 914 / 490 3.57 

Baseline Data 459 / 237 37.12 0.90 721 / 383 807 / 431 892 / 478 1.5  

Report ID: [02281302] (Generated: 05/07/2019 15:41:53)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2019 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

1.6

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

04/16/19 90 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 70 0

09/28/18 8 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 16 0

08/30/18 9 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 17 0

01/31/18 4 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 18 0

05/31/17 37 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 29 0

11/30/16 17 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 28 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 230

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

09/28/18

Looks to have been changed from previous sample. COC Flash Point already low and if safe to do so recommend venting system if possible to remove light

molecules that have potentially brought flash point down. All other parameters within allowable limits.  COC Flash Point is abnormally low.

08/30/18

COC Flash Point is very low indeed. Viscosity is trending slightly downwards also. Recommend the fluid is changed  COC Flash Point is severely low.

01/31/18

COC Flash Point significantly lower than expected, confirming also previous result. Looking at the GCD the system has potentially been vented, there look to be

fewer light end molecules. This  has however had no impact on the COC Flash Point. All other parameters look to be improved from previous result. As this is a

repeat result of the previous flash point, primary recommendation is for a system change out including a flush  COC Flash Point is severely low.

05/31/17

Oil appears to be fit for further service. Suggest sample at next scheduled maintenance interval.  COC Flash Point is severely low.

11/30/16

Oil appears to be fit for further service. Sample at next scheduled maintenance interval.  COC Flash Point is abnormally low. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is

marginally high.

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02281302] (Generated: 05/07/2019 15:41:53)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2019 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

GCD Spectrum

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

