
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

PHASE 2

Customer: PTRHTF10092 System Information Sample Information

REC GROUP

119410 RICK JONES WAY

BUTTE (SILVER BOW), MT 59750 USA

Attn: Bill Telling

Tel: (406)496-9929

E-Mail: bill.telling@recsilicon.com            

                                                                  

System Volume: 41640 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: 425F / 218C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02289106

Analyst: Ron LeBlanc 

Sample Date: 05/21/19

Received Date: 06/05/19

Completed: 06/06/19Fluid: PETRO CANADA CALFLO AF

Make: EXOTHERM

Recommendation: Sample appears normal.  Re-sample at normal interval.

Comments: 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

05/21/19 06/05/19 0y 410 / 210 11.1 30.9    0.035 0.084 691 / 366 789 / 421 884 / 473 1.64 

01/04/19 01/25/19 0y 421 / 216 12.4 30.9    0.01 0.041 665 / 352 763 / 406 858 / 459 3.99 

09/21/18 10/10/18 0y 417 / 214 8.4 30.8    0.01 0.029 698 / 370 785 / 419 877 / 469 0.00 

05/14/18 05/24/18 14y PHASE2 HOT OIL SURGE 432 / 222 8.9 30.3    0.05 0.034 699 / 371 793 / 423 901 / 483 3.27 

11/18/17 12/04/17 13y 421 / 216 7.7 30.5    0.033 0.039 683 / 361 765 / 407 894 / 479 0.26 

07/19/17 08/03/17 13y PH2 HOT OIL 406 / 208 15.7 30.9    0.01 0.015 703 / 373 789 / 421 884 / 473 0.75 

10/20/16 11/03/16 13y HOT OIL RETURN 421 / 216 5.1 34.5    0.02 0.044 695 / 368 798 / 426 897 / 480 1.92 

06/20/16 06/29/16 12y UPSTRM EXPNSN DRUM 399 / 204 17.2 31.2    0.029 0.040 688 / 364 787 / 419 899 / 482 1.98 

12/16/15 12/30/15 12y UPSTREAM EXPAN DRUM 421 / 216 19.6 28.2    0.06 0.046 690 / 366 787 / 420 879 / 471 2.09 

06/11/15 06/26/15 12y UPSTREAM EXPANSION D 414 / 212 6.3 31.0    0.08 0.047 696 / 369 796 / 424 898 / 481 1.49 

01/06/15 01/26/15 17y USTREAM OF EX DRAIN 414 / 212 5.7 31.0    0.01 0.054 702 / 372 801 / 427 888 / 476 0.60 

06/18/14 07/04/14 10y HOR RETURN/UPSTREAM 432 / 222 156.9 30.8    0.02 0.080 690 / 365 788 / 420 888 / 476 1.86 

03/07/14 03/20/14 10y HOT OIL RETURN 421 / 216 0.00 31.1    0.01 0.109 692 / 367 792 / 422 882 / 472 1.89 

10/09/13 10/23/13 9y RETURN LINE 410 / 210 19.3 31.1    0.01 0.089 695 / 368 791 / 422 882 / 472 1.61 

11/28/12 12/04/12 8y HOT OIL RETURN TO EX 410 / 210 4 30.9    0    0.014 697 / 369 789 / 420 883 / 473 1.649

10/11/11 10/17/11 UPSTREAM OF EXPANSIO 430 / 221 35 30.9    0.07 0.003 699 / 371 790 / 421 883 / 473 1.505

06/16/09 06/16/09 423 / 217 35 31.1    0    0.06 687 / 364 887 / 475 2.6  

Baseline Data 435 / 224 32.7 0.03 693 / 367 790 / 421 887 / 475 2.5  

Report ID: [02289106] (Generated: 06/06/2019 11:17:29)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2019 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

05/21/19 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 7 0

01/04/19 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 8 0

09/21/18 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 8 0

05/14/18 7 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 11 0

11/18/17 3 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 9 0

07/19/17 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 9 0

10/20/16 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 9 0

06/20/16 4 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 9 0

12/16/15 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 9 0

06/11/15 3 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 10 0

01/06/15 2 0 0 0 0 0 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 11 0

06/18/14 3 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 8 0

03/07/14 2 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 9 0

10/09/13 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 9 0

11/28/12 4 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 9 0

10/11/11 2 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 7 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 7 0

06/16/09 3 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 270

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

01/04/19

(GCD) 90% Distillation Point has dropped from previous sample.   Pentane insolubles have increased from previous sample.  Take another sample in 1 month. 

(GCD) 90% Distillation Point is abnormally low.

09/21/18

Sample appears normal.  Re-Sample at next scheduled date.

05/14/18

Sample appears normal.  Re-Sample at regular interval.

11/18/17

Sample appears normal.  Resample at normal interval.

07/19/17

Sample Normal.  No issues detected.

10/20/16

Sample appears normal.  Sample in 6 months.

06/20/16

Sample appears normal.   Resample in 6 months.



12/16/15

Sample is normal



06/11/15



Sample appears normal.   Resample at normal interval.

01/06/15



Sample appears normal.  H2O dropped significantly from 156.9 ppm last sample to 5.7 ppm in current sample.  Continue to sample at normal interval.

06/18/14



The oil condition appears to be excellent after 10 years.  Please re-sample at next scheduled interval.  Silicon has not increased and remains extremely low.

03/07/14



This fluid looks pristine after 10 years.  With the exception of 1 additive  depleted (out of the whole formulation), every single element or property tested show this

fluid looks just like fresh oil.  Please keep monitoring regularily.10/09/13



The oil condition remains good.  We suggest to perhaps place this system on sampling every 6 months.

11/28/12



The samples look identical to the last ones taken over 1 year ago.  Nothing has changed.  Silicon has not risen since the last sample.  Keep up the good work and

re-sample.  Please take advantage of this free service and sample every 6 months.10/11/11



 

06/16/09

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02289106] (Generated: 06/06/2019 11:17:29)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2019 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

