
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

10.0

WANSON TPC 1250 LN HP

Customer: PTRHTF40049 System Information Sample Information

PLUSFOOD BV

HOUTWAL 30

OOSTERWOLDE 8431EX

OOSTERWOLDE,  8431EX Netherlands

Attn: WILBERT SNIJERS

Tel: 

E-Mail: w.snijers@klt.nl                             

System Volume: 5000 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 212F / 100C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02294632

Analyst: Philip Riley 

Sample Date: 06/21/19

Received Date: 07/02/19

Completed: 07/18/19Fluid: PETRO CANADA PURITY FG HEAT TRANSFER FLUID

Make: WANSON

Recommendation: Several parameters off specification with clear evidence of fluid degradation as well as low flash point,

viscosity etc. Recommend a fluid change, including a flush of the system

Comments: Pentane Insolubles levels are severely high. (GCD) % < 335°C is severely high. (GCD) 10% Distillation Point is

severely low. COC Flash Point is severely low. Visc @ 40°C is severely low. (GCD) 50% Distillation Point is abnormally low.

(GCD) 90% Distillation Point is marginally low.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

06/21/19 07/02/19 11y 298 / 148 43.9 19.4    0.448 0.598 490 / 255 730 / 388 866 / 463 30.64

06/01/18 06/08/18 10y 280 / 138 19.0 19.0    0.11 0.428 459 / 237 647 / 342 823 / 439 46.56

05/09/17 05/12/17 9y 302 / 150 88.4 21.6    0.532 0.441 563 / 295 776 / 413 955 / 513 17.49

02/15/17 02/22/17 9y 295 / 146 4.4 30.6    0.391 0.081 562 / 295 784 / 418 902 / 484 16.38

11/07/16 11/21/16 9y 280 / 138 19.4 21.4    0.352 0.198 563 / 295 783 / 417 916 / 491 16.71

05/07/16 07/11/16 8y 270 / 132 23.3 19.2    0.10 0.163 547 / 286 770 / 410 903 / 484 19.05

Baseline Data 459 / 237 37.12 0.90 721 / 383 807 / 431 892 / 478 1.5  

Report ID: [02294632] (Generated: 07/18/2019 03:50:13)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2019 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

10.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

06/21/19 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 37 0

06/01/18 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 43 0

05/09/17 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 60 0

02/15/17 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 64 0

11/07/16 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 57 0

05/07/16 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 48 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 230

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

06/01/18

Out of spec in numerous parameters including viscosity, insoluble etc. Most seriously the COC Flash Point is severely low and recommend an immediate change, flush of the

system to rid the circuit of any carryover product and refill with fresh oil Pentane Insolubles levels are abnormally high. (GCD) % < 335°C is severely high. (GCD) 10% Distillation

Point is severely low. (GCD) 50% Distillation Point is severely low. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is severely low. COC Flash Point is severely low. Visc @ 40°C is severely low.

05/09/17

Oil is not in good condition suggest changing the oil at the next available interval. Pentane Insolubles levels are abnormally high. (GCD) % < 335°C is severely

high. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is severely high. (GCD) 10% Distillation Point is severely low. COC Flash Point is severely low. Visc @ 40°C is severely low.

02/15/17

Oil appears to be in reasonable condition and fit for further service at this time. However consideration should now be given as to whether to change the oil within

the next maintenance interval.  (GCD) 10% Distillation Point is severely low. COC Flash Point is severely low. (GCD) % < 335°C is abnormally high.

11/07/16

Recommend an oil change.  (GCD) % < 335°C is severely high. (GCD) 10% Distillation Point is severely low. COC Flash Point is severely low. Visc @ 40°C is

severely low. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is marginally high.

05/07/16

Oil contains low boilers. Consider Oil change.  (GCD) % < 335°C is severely high. (GCD) 10% Distillation Point is severely low. COC Flash Point is severely low.

Visc @ 40°C is severely low.

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02294632] (Generated: 07/18/2019 03:50:13)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2019 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

