
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

1.6

RELUTHERM

Customer: PTRHTF40056 System Information Sample Information

SOFINE FOODS BV

SPERWERWEG  7

LANDGRAAF 6374AG

LANDGRAAF,  6374AG Netherlands

Attn: WILBERT SNIJERS

Tel: 

E-Mail: w.snijers@klt.nl                             

System Volume: 1400 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 265F / 129C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02307723

Analyst: Philip Riley 

Sample Date: 09/05/19

Received Date: 09/11/19

Completed: 09/15/19Fluid: PETRO CANADA PURITY FG HEAT TRANSFER FLUID

Make: RELUTHERM

Recommendation: COC creeping downwards but no step change from last sample and little evidence on the GC of light

molecules present. Re-sample at normal frequency

Comments: (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is marginally high. COC Flash Point is marginally low.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

09/05/19 09/11/19 12y 392 / 200 20.5 32.5    0.465 0.081 717 / 380 819 / 437 911 / 488 2.34 

08/23/18 08/28/18 11y 396 / 202 15.4 33.0    0.36 0.040 710 / 376 805 / 430 903 / 484 0.54 

10/05/17 10/12/17 10y 403 / 206 6.0 34.0    0.464 0.082 715 / 379 814 / 434 903 / 484 2.14 

10/04/16 10/11/16 9y 406 / 208 14.0 33.5    0.49 0.069 714 / 379 822 / 439 916 / 491 2.44 

11/10/15 11/23/15 8y PTRHTF40056 453 / 234 10.0 33.2    0.40 0.037 714 / 379 816 / 435 908 / 487 2.50 

11/17/14 12/01/14 7y 419 / 215 6.4 33.4    0.543 0.050 723 / 384 822 / 439 917 / 492 0.98 

Baseline Data 459 / 237 37.12 0.90 721 / 383 807 / 431 892 / 478 1.5  

Report ID: [02307723] (Generated: 09/15/2019 16:00:34)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2019 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

1.6

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

09/05/19 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 10 0

08/23/18 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 12 0

10/05/17 4 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 17 0

10/04/16 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 14 0

11/10/15 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 12 0

11/17/14 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 14 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 230

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

08/23/18

Marginally low COC Flash Point which has trended slightly downwards over previous annual samples. All other parameters within expected limits. Check required

at normal period and be prepared to take action if the COC Flash Pt slips further  COC Flash Point is marginally low.

10/05/17

COC slightly down and highlighted as caution. Small top up would elevate to spec. All other parameters look OK  COC Flash Point is marginally low.

10/04/16

Oil appears to be fit for further service. Suggest sample at next scheduled maintenance interval.

11/10/15

Oil appears to be in good condition and fit for further service.Suggest sample at next scheduled maintenance interval.

11/17/14

Oil appears to be in good condition.Sample at next scheduled maintenance interval.

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02307723] (Generated: 09/15/2019 16:00:34)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2019 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

